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BALLAST WATER RESEARCH AND DEVELOPMENT FUNDING
LEVY BILL 1997

OUTLINE (
The purposeof theBallast WaterResearchand DevelopmentFundingLevyBill 1997
and theBallast WaterResearchand DevelopmentFundingLevyCollectionBill 1997
is to establisha levy to providefunds for the StrategicBallastWaterResearch
and DevelopmentProgram. This Programis to provide the framework for
planning and implementing innovative and cost-effective researchand
developmentprojectsto strengthenmanagementof ballastwaterandshipping
by risk minimisation,andthe eventualgoal of preventingall introductionsof
harmfulexotic species,by meansof ballastwateror shipshull fouling.

The Bills will enablethe collectionof a levy amountof $210 for bulk carriers
and $140 for all otherships, including tankers,with a length of 50 metresor
longer. The levy amountshavebeenestimatedbasedon the bestinformation
available from the AustralianMaritime SafetyAuthority and the Australian
shippingindustry. Theformulaof a two-tieredflat chargewasagreeduponby
the Australian Ballast Water ManagementAdvisory Council and the levy
Working Group. Thelevy is chargedin accordancewith the averageamountof
ballastwaterdischargedby thetypeof ship,in anattemptto establishequity.

The amountto be collected is $2 million over a 2 year timeframe,basedon
collectinganestimated$1 million peryear. Oncethe $2 million hasbeenraised,
the levy will beceasedby Proclamation.

The moneycollectedfrom the levy will fund the researchanddevelopmentof
effectivemeansof treating ballast water and ships’ hulls to renderthem
incapableof transportingexotic marinespeciesbetweenports. In the absence
of suchtreatments,every shipenteringaport potentiallycarriesexotic species
that may pose a significant threat to the Australian fishing industry, the
environmentandhumanhealth.

FINANCIAL IMPACT STATEMENT

Theproposedlevy will haveno financial implicationsfor theCommonwealth.
Thelevy is being implementedwith the full agreementandcooperationof the
Australian BallastWater ManagementAdvisory Council and the shipping
industry which will pay the levy, and is to be allocatedto the researchand
developmentof effectiveballast water managementstrategies. The agreed
amountto be collectedby the levy is $2 million overa two year timeframe,
basedon collectingan estimated$1 million peryear. The Industry hasagreed
that if the $2 million is collectedprior to the 2 years,the levy will ceasedby
Proclamation.
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REGULATION IMPACT STATEMENT

Problem and Background

It has beenestablishedthat ballast water and sedimentin vesselsentering
Australianwaters hasbeencontaminatedwith a rangeof unwantedmarine
organisms,including toxic dinoflagellate speciesknown to causeparalytic
shellfish poisoning in humans. The introduction of diseasesposing health
threatsto indigenoushuman,animalandplant life alsocanariseas a resultof
port waters beinginoculatedwith largequantitiesof ballastwater containing
virusesor bacteria.

It hasbeenconfirmedthat at least15 unwantedaquaticspeciesandorganisms,
including fish, molluscs,worms and a toxic algae,havebeentransferredto
Australia and establishedhere. The most likely sourceof transferis ballast
water. While ballastwaterhasbeenusedby shippingfor around100 years,it is
only recently that the extent of the problem has becomeknown. Shipping
traffic hasincreased,traveltime betweenports hasbecomemoreefficient, and
asmanyof theports with which Australiatradesbecomemore‘polluted’, the
threatto Australianwaterwayshasincreasedenormously.

Ballastwater managementis now recognisedinternationally as an important
global issue,and Australian scientistswere amongthe first to recognisethe
risks posed to our marine environment, our fisheries and aquaculture
industries,andon humanhealth,by unmanagedballastwater.

In 1990, Australia was the first country in the world to introducenational
voluntary controls to apply to the dischargeof shippingballast water and
sedimentfrom overseasvesselsenteringAustralianterritory. This initiative
wassubsequentlyadoptedby the InternationalMaritime Organisationwhen,in
1991, it incorporatedthe principles of the Australian arrangementsfor
internationalapplication.

In 1995, Australia developedits Ballast Water ManagementStrategy. The
StrategicBallast Water Researchand DevelopmentProgramwhich is a key
componentof the Strategywas subsequentlyimplementedin 1995 by the
Australian Ballast Water ManagementAdvisory Council. The aim of the
StrategicBallastWaterResearchandDevelopmentProgramis to provide the
framework for planning and implementinginnovative and cost-effective
researchprojects to improve ballast water managementand to seekmore
satisfactorylongerterm solutionsto theproblem.

The Governmenthasa seriousconcerntowardsthe sustainableuse andrepair
of our coastlineandthe threatof coastalandmarinepollution. In March 1997
the Prime Minister announcedthe Government’sCoastsand Clean Seas
Initiative. Through the Initiative the Governmentwill tackle pollution

problems,

threatsto marinebiodiversityandhabit degradation,and promote
the sustainableuseof Australia’s coastalareasandmarineenvironment. This
Initiative will provide funding for the reduction, managementand local
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eradicationof introducedmarinepests; a rapid responsecapability to manage
and eradicatemarinepest outbreaksbeforethey becomeestablishedin new
locations; and the implementation of managementarrangementsand
guidelinesto preventthe spreadof peststransferredby coastalshipping.
Includedin this funding is the allocationof $1 million for the StrategicBallast
WaterResearchProgramfor 1997/98.

Objective

The aim of the proposedlevy is to provide funding for the researchand
developmentof effectiveballastwater managementpolicies. Currentmajor
researchprojects include the developmentof a decisionsupportsystem(an
information and communicationssystemto monitor and support decision
making concerning the risk of individual vessels and required ballast
managementarrangements);port baselinesurveys(to ascertainexistingport
conditions); andheattreatmentof ballastwater(asa possiblemeansof killing
unwantedmarinepestsandpathogens).Future projectswill include further
evaluation of techniquesfor the detection of cholera in ballast water,
identification of high risk vesselsand routes,and the implementationof
protocolsfor ballastwatersamplingandtesting.

Options

The AustralianBallastWaterManagementAdvisory Council proposedto the
Governmentthat a levy on shipping to raisea total agreedamount of $2
million, be collectedand paid into the StrategicBallast Water Researchand
DevelopmentFund. ThisFundwill thenprovidethe resourcesfor researchand
developmentaimed at minimising the risk, and in the longer term possible
prevention, of the introduction of unwanted marine pests and disease
pathogenstransportedin ballastwaterandonships’hulls.

There are no other options for considerationas the Minister for Primary
Industries and Energy receivedapprovalin February1997 from the Prime
Minister andtheTreasurerto introducethelevy.
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Impact Analysis

The levy hasbeendesigned,in consultationwith industry,to havea minimal
financial impact on the shippingindustrywhile providing adequatefundsfor
its purpose.It hasbeenfully supportedby the industrywho will pay thelevy.

The levy amount to be charged,$210 for bulk carriersand $140 for all other
ships, including tankers,with a length of 50 metresor longer, hasa relatively
low impactonthe industrywhencomparedwith costsup to $20,000perdayfor
a shipwhile idle in a port.

The levy amountshavebeenestimatedbasedon thebestinformation available
from the Australian Maritime Safety Authority and the Australianshipping
industry. The formula of a two-tiered flat chargewas agreedupon by the
AustralianBallastWaterManagementAdvisory Council anda Working Group
of industry and Governmentofficials establishedfor the expresspurposeof
determiningthe parametersof this legislation. It also meetsthe Government’s
principlesfor new or amendedlevy legislation.

In the interestsof equity the levy is to be chargedin accordancewith the
averageamountof ballastwater dischargedby thetype of ship. For further
clarificationof the chargingformula,bulk liquid carriersor tankersareincluded
in the category“otherwise” as they usually enterAustralianports with full
cargo and thereforedo not dischargeballastwater on arrival. Bulk carriers
usually load cargo at Australian ports and thereforethey usuallydischarge
ballaston arrival.

The shippingindustrywhich will pay the levy supportsthe introductionof the
levy; this agreementto the implementationof a levy is an indication of their
commitment to resolving the risks posed to Australia’s coastline from
unmanagedballastwater.

Thereareno (or minimal) negativeimpactson Government,consumersandthe
community. Howeverthere are indirect positivebenefits, for example,the
potential for improvementin the Australiancoastalenvironment,facilitation of
trade,andpreventionof humanillnessattributedto unmanagedballastwater
discharge.

Consultation

The AustralianBallast WaterManagementAdvisory Council, which includes
shippingandbulk exportingrepresentatives,hasbeenclosely consultedfor the
duration of the developmentof the Ballast Water Researchand Development
Funding LevyBill 1997 andthe Ballast WaterResearchand DevelopmentFunding
Levy Collection Bill 1997. This consultativeprocesshas taken place through
meetingsand regular written advice inviting commentsfrom the Industry
representatives,on the draftingof thelegislation.
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Implementation, administration and review

The legislationauthorisescollectionof the levy until $2 million hasbeenraised.
The Act will thenbe ceasedby Proclamation.Also agreedis thatshouldthe $2
million be collectedprior to the 2 full years,the Act will ceaseon collectionof
the amountof $2 million.

The levy is payableto an authorisedperson,appointedby the Minister or by
the Departmentof Primary IndustriesandEnergyon the Minister’s behalf. The
levy canbe paid to theauthorisedpersonat the ship’shomeport or at another
Australianport specifiedin writing by theowneror agentof theship. Thelevy
will be collectedusingtheexistinglevy collectionmechanismprovidedby the
AustralianCustomsService.

The levy paymentscanbemadein person,by post,by electronictransferor by
otherpreferredmethodsof paymentasprescribedby the ship’sowner,master,
agentor consignee.

The moneycollectedby thelevy will be paid into theConsolidatedRevenue
Fund andthen the levy amountwill be transferredinto the StrategicBallast
WaterResearchandDevelopmentFund.
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NOTES ON CLAUSES

Clause1: Short title

1. This clauseprovidesfor the Act to be calledthe Ballast Water Researchand
DevelopmentFundingLevyAct 1997.

Clause2: Commencement

2. This clauseprovidesfor theAct to comeinto effecton 1 July 1998.

Clause3: Interpretation

3. This clauseprovidesthe definition of ‘bulk carrier’ as appliedin this Act.
Thiscategoryappliesprimarily to bulk carriersloadingexportproducts.

Clause4: Application to Crown

4. This clauseprovidesfor the Act to apply in all the Australian states,the
Australian Capital Territory (Jervis Bay), the Northern Territory and
Norfolk Island.

Clause5: Impositionof levy

5. This clauseprovidesfor the levy to be paid by certainships arriving at
Australian ports, in accordancewith the Ballast Water Researchand
DevelopmentFunding Levy Collection Act 1997. That Act providesthe
categoriesof shipsliable to paythe levy, andstatesthat thelevy is payable
on the first day of eachquarter.Also definedare situationscategorisedas
anemergencywhich exemptashipfrom payingthe levy.

Clause6: Amount of levy

6. This clauseprovidestherateof levy payableby thetwo categoriesof ships,
$210 for bulk carriers; $140 for all other ships, including bulk liquid
tankersprimarily carrying importedproducts. The category‘otherwise’
relatesto shipsof 50 metresor longer,andthereforeliable to paythe levy.

Printedby Authorityby theCommonwealthGovernmentPrinter
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