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COMPLAINTS(AUSTRALIAN FEDERALPOLICE)AMENDMENT BILL 1994

OUTLINE

This Bill amendstheComplaints(AustralianFederalPolice)Act 1981 (‘the I
ComplaintsAct’), whichgovernsthehandlingof complaintsmade,whetherby the
publicorby AustralianFederalPolicemembers,againsttheAustralianFederalPolice
andits members,includingdisciplinarymeasuresconsequenton acomplaintandall
disciplinaryappeals.

Theamendmentsariseoutof thereportof aninter-DepartmentalWorkingGroup
which wasestablishedin mid-1991,comprisingrepresentativesof the
Attorney-General’sDepartment,theDepartmentof thePrimeMinisterandCabinet,
theOfficeof theCommonwealthOmbudsmanandtheAustralianFederalPolice. In
consultationwith the AustralianFederalPoliceAssociation,theWorking Group
consideredproposalsby all interestedpartiesaswell asreportsof boththe Royal
Commissioninto AboriginalDeathsin Custodyandthe SenateStandingCommittee
on FinanceandPublic Administration’sReviewof theOmbudsman’sOffice.

Theresultingamendmentsdo notalter thelong-standingpolicy principlesof the
ComplaintsAct, butaredesignedsimply to eliminateanomaliesandto meetpractical
concernsarisingout of theoperationof theActsinceits commencement(andin
particularfollowing theintroductionof thenewAlP rankstructure).

Themajoramendmentsare:

(a) toextendtheAct’s coverageto includenon-swornAPPstaff(whoseexclusion
from the ComplaintsAct regimeis no longerjustified by differentialallocation
of dutiestomembersandstaffmembers);

(b) to createtwo new offences:makingafalsecomplaintor giving falseinformation,
andvictimisationof a complainantor apersonassistingin the investigationof a
complaint;

(c) to providefor investigationsby the Ombudsmanor InvestigationDivision,on the
Ombudsman’sown motion,of actionby amemberor staffmemberofthe AFP;

(d) to makeevidenceobtainedby theOmbudsmanin thecourseof an investigation
admissiblein disciplinaryhearings;and

(e) to abolishthe requirementthathearingsof complalnt-baseddisciplinarycharges
beheldbeforetheDisciplinaryTribunalwherethe appointeechargedpleads
guilty. The optionof aTribunalhearingwherethe public interestrequiresit is
retained.

Otherminor amendmentsincludechangesto therankrequirementsfor conciliatorsin
complaintscases,anextensionof the Ombudsman’sdiscretionto determinethata
complaintshouldnot beinvestigatedwherehe or sheis satisfiedthatit is trivial,
adjustmentstopenaltyprovisionsto bring them into line with currentpolicy andthe
removalof sexistterminology.

FINANCiAL IMPACT STATEMENT

Theamendmentswill haveno financialimpact.
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NOTES ON CLAUSES

Clause1: Short Title etc.

Clause1 is aformalprovisionspecifyingtheshorttitle of the Bill andidentifying the
Complaints(AustralianFederalPolice)Act1981 (‘the PrincipalAct’) as the
PrincipalAct amendedby theBill. Thecommencementdateis providedfor underthe
ActsInterpretationAct 1901.

Clause2: Definitions

Following the establishmentby theAustralianFederalPoliceLegislationAmendment
Act(No. 2)1989of aunified policeforce,the work of swornandnon-sworn
AustralianFederalPoliceemployees(‘members’and‘staff members’respectively)
hasbecomeincreasinglyinterrelated,sothatthe dutiesof staffmembersareno longer
of aconsistentlydifferentnaturefrom thoseof members.The continuedexclusionof
staffmembersfrom thefull complaintsregimeis thereforeunjustified. Thepurpose
of theamendmentsin clause2is to facilitatethe extensionof variousaspectsof the
complaintsregimeto staffmembersof theAustralianFederalPolice(‘the AFP’).

First,clause2 amendstheinterpretationsectionof thePrincipalAct(section3) by
replacingthe terms‘member’, ‘memberof the AFP’ and‘staff member’with two new
terms. The term ‘AFPappointee’createsabroadcategorywhich includesemployees
definedundertheAustralianFederalPoliceAct 1979 asmembers,staffmembersand
specialmembers,butdoesnot include pesonsemployedon atemporarybasisunder
section39A orconsultantsemployedundersection39B of thatAct. Because
consultantsareemployedon acontractualbasis,contractualremediesare the
appropriatemeansof dealingwith matterswhichwould otherwisefall within the
statutoryregime. Theothernewterm,‘Federalpoliceofficer’, createsanarrower
categorywhichis equivalentto, but morespecific than,the existingcategoryof
‘member’.

Secondly,clause2 extendsthe applicationof subsection3(3) to all APP appointees.
Subsection3(3) concernsreferencesto actiontakenin relationto theemploymentof
membersin generalas well as theemploymentof particularmembers.It also
concernsreferencesto the giving of cautionsandadmonitionsandthechargingof
membersin respectof breachesof discipline.

Clause3: Conciliation

Section6B of thePrincipalAct is concernedwith theresolutionof complalntsby
conciliation.

Clause3 amendssection6B in two respects.First,it extendsto all APP appointees
protectionagainsttheusein anyotherproceedingsof evidencegivenby amemberin
the courseof an attemptto resolveacomplaintby conciliation.

Secondly,it alterstherequirementsof rankfor a ‘seniormember’ (being apersonwho
may bedirectedby the Commissionerorofficer inchargeto attemptaconciliation
undersubsection6B(1)), to reflectboth theabolition of therankof seniorsergeantand
thescarcityof officersabovethenew mergedrankof sergeantfollowing the
consolidationof theAFP rankstructure.
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Clause4: Action consequentialon report

Section 11 of thePrincipalAct concernsdeterminationsmadeby the Commissionerin
relationto the chargingof AFP members.

Clause4 amendsparagraph11(1)(b)of thePrincipalActsoas to requirethe
Commissioner,in determiningwhetheranychargeshouldbe laid, to consider
(togetherwith anyreportof theresultsof aspecialor additionalinvestigationof a
complaintby theOmbudsman)anyrecommendationsreceivedby him or herunderthe
newsubsection26(3A) (insertedby clause10).

Clause5: Transfersto InvestigationDivision I
Section16 of thePrincipalActconcernsthenumberof membersbeingtransferredto
andfrom theInvestigationDivision, andthedutieswhichcanbeperformedby the
membersof theDivision.

Clause5 amendssection16 by replacingreferencesto a‘member’ in
subsections16(1)and(2) with themorespecific ‘Federalpoliceofficer’, maintaining
theexisting distinctionbetweenmembersandstaffmembersin relationto thetransfer
of employeesto theInternalInvestigationDivision.

Theoriginal subsection16(3)concernedthedutieswhichcould beperformedby
membersof the Division,andspecifiedthattheinvestigationof offencesallegedto
havebeencommittedby personsotherthanmemberscould notbeinvestigated.

Thishasbeenreplacedby new subsections(3), (4) and(5). The newsubsection(3)
allows membersof the lnvestigationDivision to performdutiesthatarenot relatedto
the Division’s functionsif theCommissionersodirects,andprovidedtheperformance
of thosedutiesdoesnot undulyinterferewith the performanceby theDivisionof its
functions. The Commissionercannot,however,directamemberto investigatean
offenceallegedto havebeencommittedby a personotherthananAFP appointee
(subsection(4)), unlessit is necessaryfor thefull investigationof anAFP appointee
(subsection(5)). Theseprovisionsapplyto investigationsof staffmembersas weltas
members.Theyare intendedto protectthe admissibilityof evidence,while
maintaininga strongfocuson policewrongdoing.

Clause6: Falsecomplaintsandprovidingfalseinformationin relationto
complaints

Clause6reflectsaconcernthatthemakingof falsecomplaintshasbecomeameansby
which somepersonschargedwith aseriouscriminal offenceseekto ‘muddy the
waters’by castingdoubton theintegrity of police. Someallegationsmaybe
extremelyseriousandcan be disastrousfor theofficers involved andtheir families. In
suchcases,someprotectionfor innocentappointeesis desirable.

The amendmentintroducesan offenceof providingwhattheoffenderknowsto be
materiallyfalseinformationto an AlP appointeein relationto acomplaintoraction
takenby an APPappointee.The penaltyfor the newoffenceis comparablewith the
penaltyfor providingmisleadingor falseinformationto theOmbudsmanunder
subsection44(2)of thePrincipalAct (asamendedby Schedule3 of this Bill). 4
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Proposedsubsections19(1)and(2) areintendedto beusedonly in themostserious
cases,wheretheneedto protectanappointeeoutweighsthepossibility thatfearof
prosecutionmightdetergenuinecomplainants.In orderto safeguardagainstabuse,) proposedsubsection19(3)will requirethatproceedingsbecommencedonly after the
Commissionerconsultswith the Ombudsmanwho,like the APP,hasa substantial
interestin the administrationof the ComplaintsActandin thepublicperceptionof its
administration.

Clause 7:Ombudsman mayinitiate investigation

UndertheOmbudsmanAct1976 (‘the OmbudsmanAct’) theOmbudsmancan initiate
investigationsof administrativeactionson his orherownmotion. ThePrincipalAct,
however,doesnot makeequivalentprovisionfor the investigationof actionby APP
members.The absenceof this importantpoweris ananomalywhich clause7, and
relatedclauses8,9, 13, 15, 16 and21,areintendedto rectify.

Clause7 amendsthePrincipalAct to providefor initiation by theOmbudsmanon his
or herownmotionof aninvestigationof theactionsof anAPPappointee.Thispower
is in addition to theOmbudsman’spresentpower to investigatesuchactionwhereit is
the subjectof acomplaint.

Underproposedsection21A , theOmbudsmanmayeitherinitiate hisor herown
investigationor, with theexceptionof proceduralmatters,mayreferthe matterto the
InvestigationDivision (in the scheme.ofthe PrincipalAct, mattersproceduralin
substance-in relationto which section21A adoptstheterminologyof theexisting
subsections23(1)and(5) - shouldbehandledby theOmbudsman).Whetherthe
Ombudsmanchoosesto referthe matterto the InvestigationDivision will dependon
its character.

Clause8: Dutiesof Ombudsmanwith respectto complaints

Subsection23(4)of thePrincipalAct providesthatwherethe Ombudsmanhasof his
or herown motioncommenced,underparagraph5(1)(b) of theOmbudsmanAct, to
investigateactiontakenby amember,andbeor shesubsequentlyreceivesacomplaint
or particularsof acomplaintconcerningthatactionundersection6 of thePrincipal
Act, the OmbudsmanAct investigationis to ceaseandthematter is insteadto be
investigatedunderthePrincipalAct. Theproposedamendmentallows for the
introductionof anown-motionpowerunderthePrincipalAct by alsoexcluding
paragraph5(l)(b) investigationswherethe Ombudsmanproposesto dealwith the
matterunderthenewsection21A(insertedby clause7 of thisBill).

Clause8 is notintendedto requirethe Ombudsmanto ceaseanown-motion

investigation
beingcarriedout underthe new section21A, shouldacomplaintbe

receivedon the samesubject-matter.It maybemoreconvenientto continuethe
Ombudsman-initiatedinvestigation,in the courseof which thesubstanceof the
complaintwill be investigated.Rather,clause8 is intendedto preventthe duplication
of effort involvedin simultaneousinvestigationsconductedunderthe two Acts
referredto above.
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Clause9: Ombudsmanmaydeterminethatcomplaintshouldnot be investigated

Undersection24 of the PrincipalAct, the Ombudsmanhasadiscretionto determine
that in certaincircumstancesacomplaintshouldnot beinvestigated,or investigated
further, asthe caserequires.

Thegroundsfor refusingto investigatea complaintsetoutin subparagraph24(l)(bXi)
arefrivolity, vexatiousnessandbadfaith. The proposedamendmentaddstriviality to
this list as an independentground,sothatthewasteof time andresourcesinvolved in
theinvestigationof very minormatterscan beavoided. 4
Clause10: Specialor additionalinvestigationsconductedby Ombudsmanunder
this Part

Section26 of thePrincipalAct appliesto theinvestigationof acomplaintconducted
by theOmbudsmanundersection36 (wherethe Ombudsmanis not satisfiedwith the
resultsof aninvestigationconductedby the InvestigationDivision anddecidesto
conducthis or herown investigation),orsection46(wheretheOmbudsmanandthe
Commissionerhaveagreedor the MinisterhasdeterminedthattheOmbudsman
shouldconductan investigation).

Subsection26(3)enablesthe Ombudsman,whenreportingto theCommissionerthe
resultsof his or herinvestigation,to recommendthatamemberbe chargedwith an
offenceorbreachof discipline,orofferedacautionor admonitionforabreachof
discipline. Subclause10(a)amendssubsection26(3)to providethat, in addition to
recommendingdisciplinaryaction,the Ombudsmanmayrequestthe Ministerto cause
aninquiry undersection50 to be held,or maynotify theCommissionerthatan APP
appointeetook actionwhichhe or sheshouldnot havetaken. New subsections26(3A)
and(3B)providethat, further, theOmbudsmanmaymakeanyrecommendationshe or
shethinks fit to the Commissioner,togetherwith arequestto beadvisedwithin a
specific timelimit of the actionthe Commissionerproposesto takein response.

Subclause10(b)amendssubsection26(5) to extendto all APPappointees(to whom
therestof section26 appliesby virtue of clause2 of thisBill) therequirementthatthe
Commissionerfurnishparticularsandcommentsregardinganinvestigationto the
memberconcerned.

Subclause10(c) incorporatesinto section26 provisionsequivalentto theexisting
subsections36(4)to (6) (the lastbeingamendedto referto completionof an
investigationby theOmbudsmanratherthanreceiptof areportfrom theInvestigation
Division).

Clause11: Powerto obtaininformationanddocuments

Subsection27(5)of thePrincipalAct enablesthe Ombudsmanto obtainevidence
underPartIll of the Actwhich wouldotherwisebe protectedby otherlegislation,by
public interestconsiderationsor by privilege by removingthesegroundsfor refusalto
complywith arequestfor informationor for theproductionof documentsor records.

Suchevidenceis generallynot admissibleagainstapersonin proceedings,with the
exceptionssetout in paragraphs(5)(d)and(e). Clause11 providesfor anadditional
exceptionunderthenewparagraph(f), whichmakesevidenceobtainedunderPartIll
admissibleagainstan APP appointeein proceedingsfor or in relationto abreachof

6



discipline. The proposedamendmentwill put the Ombudsmanon a level with the
InvestigationDivision in thisregard(seesection7 of thePrincipalAct) by removinga
restrictionon admissibilityof evidencewhich underminesthepositionof the
Ombudsmanastheinvestigatorof lastresort.

Clause12: Personsaffectedto be informedof resultsof investigationby
Ombudsman

Section34 of thePrincipalAct requirestheOmbudsman,on completionof an‘ investigation,to furnishto theCommissionerandthe complainantparticularsof the
resultsof the investigation. TheOmbudsmanis alsogiven adiscretionto provide
progressreportsatanytimeduring the courseof aninvestigation.

Clause12 amendssection34 to allow theOmbudsmanto informaffectedpersonsof
theresultsof any investigations,includingown-motioninvestigationswhichdo not
ariseout of a complaintbut areinitiated by theOmbudsmanunderthenewsection
21A (insertedbyclause7of thisBill).

Clause13: Ombudsmanto inform complainantof resultsof investigation

Section37 of thePrincipalAct dealswith themannerin which the Ombudsmanis
requiredto dealwith reportsreceivedby him or herfrom the InvestigationDivision
concerningmattersoriginally the subjectof acomplaintto theOmbudsman.In
particular,the Ombudsmanmustfurnishparticularsof theinvestigationandany
proposedrecommendationsto the complainant.

Subclause13(a) extendsthe applicationof the sectionto acomplaintoriginally made
directly to amemberof theAPP.

Subclause13(b)extendssection37 to coverstaffmembers,againstwhomcomplaints
or own-motioninvestigationsby theOmbudsmanmaynow bemadeby virtueof
clause2ofthis Bill.

Subclause13(c) simplycorrectsanerrorin subsection37(2)of thePrincipalAct.

Clause14: Progressreportsaboutcomplaints

Clause14 insertsinto the PrincipalAct section38A,which providesthat progress
reportsmaybefurnishedby the Ombudsmanto complainantsunderthePrincipalAct
atanytime. This is arelocationof anexistingprovision(subsection34(2).omittedby
clause12 of this Bill).

K A progressreportgivento acomplainantunderproposedsection38A isnot intended
to replaceanyotherreport. Rather,its purposeis to supply thecomplainantwith
additionalinfonnation. The reportneednot bein writing or anyotherparticularform
andits issueis a matterfor the Ombudsman’sdiscretion.

Clause15: Reportsof specialinquiries

‘ Section52 of thePrincipalAct providesthatwhereapersonis appointedby the
Minister to holdan inquiry undersection50,that personis to reportto the Ministerthe
resultsof theinquiry andmakesuchrecommendationsas he or shethinksfit. If the
sjecial inquiry undersection50wasmadepursuantto arequestfrom theOmbudsman
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underparagraph36(2XaXii), thenon receiptof thereporttheMinister is requiredto
furnishacopy thereofto theOmbudsman.

Such arequestcanalsobemadeunderproposedparagraph26(3Xb) (insertedby
clause10of thisBill). Subclause15(b)amendssection52 torequiretheMinister to
furnishtheOmbudsmanwith acopyof the resultingreport.

Subclause15(c)amendssection52 to allow theMinisterto chargenotonly amember,
but anyAPP appointeewith abreachof discipline,or offer acautionor admonitionas
aresultof an investigationundersection50. 4
Subclauses15(a),(d) and(e) amendsection52 to introducegender-neutral
terminology.

Clause16: New PanVA Undisputedcharges

At present,whereamemberis chargedin disciplinaryproceedingsandis foundguilty,
thedeterminationas to penaltyis madeeitherby theCommissioneror by the
DisciplinaryTribunal,dependingon whetheror notthechargearosefromacomplaint.
Wherethechargedid not arisefrom acomplaint,thematteris dealtwith by the
Commissioner.In theremainingcases,aTribunalhearingmustbeconducted.

In practice,whereamemberpleadsguilty to adisciplinarycharge,a Tribunalhearing
becomesamereformality andtendsto prolongtheprocessunnecessarily.The
proposedamendmentssetout in clause16 abolishtheautomaticdistinctionbetween
chargeswhichdo anddo notarisefrom acomplaint,while retainingtheoption of a
Tribunalhearingwherethe interestsof thepublic aresuchthatit wouldserveareal
purpose.

Clause16 insertsanewPartVA in the PrincipalAct comprisingnewsections52A to

Newsection52A - Undisputedchargesin respectof breachesof discipline

Proposedsection52A providesthat,wherean APPappointeepleadsguilty to a
disciplinarychargearisingeitherfrom acomplaintor otherwise,andthe
Commissionerthinksthatthepublic interestrequirestheproceedingsto bedealLwith
by theDisciplinary Tribunal,thenaTribunalhearingshouldbeheld. if not, andthe
Ombudsmanagreesin writing, thentheproceedingsshouldbedealtwith by the
Commissioneras if theydid not arisefrom acomplaint. Wherethe Ombudsmandoes
not agree,thematterwill bedecidedby theAttomey-General,who in making his or
herdecisionmustconsideranyrelevantreport,notificationorrecommendationand
theresultsof anyrelevantinquiries.

Newsection52B - Commissionermayimposepenalty

If afterhearingthemattertheCommissionerfinds theAFP appointeeguilty, he or she
may,underproposedsection52B, imposeapenalty. If theCommissionerconsiders
thattheappropriatepenaltyis onewhichresultsin loweringof rank or Level or in
dismissal,theappointeemustbe givennoticein writing andanopportunityto provide
written submissionson the appropriatepenalty.

Newsection52C - Ombudsmanto be notified of penalty
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As soonas possibleafter imposingapenalty,the Commissionermustnotify both the

Ombudsmanandtheappointeeuponwhomthe penaltyis imposed.

Newsection52D - OmbudsmanmayinformAttorney-Generalof penalty

If theOmbudsmanconsidersthepenaltyto beinadequate,heor shemayreportin
writing andwith commentsto the Attomey General.

Newsection52E - Appeals

Uponreceiptof notificationfrom theOmbudsmanunderproposedsection52D,the
Attorney-GeneralmayappealagainsttheCommissioner’sdecision. Similarly, if the
appointeeon whom thepenaltyis imposedconsidersit excessive,heor shemay
appeal.Appealswill bedealtwith by theDisciplinary Tribunalundersection68 of
thePrincipalAct, asif theTribunalhadremittedproceedingsto theCommissionerand
the Commissioner’ssubsequentdecisionon penaltyundersubsection67(6)of thatAct
hadbeenchallengedby the appointeeor the Attorney-Generalundersubsection68(1).
Sections74 (public hearings)and75 (right to representation)applyto thisappeal
process.

Clause17: Chargesin respectof breachesof discipline

Section67 of thePrincipalAct specifieshowchargesfor breachesof disciplineshould
bedealtwith accordingto theavenueusedby theoriginal complainantto lodgehis or
hercomplaint. The authorityto whichthecomplaintwas originally directed(either
Commissioneror Ombudsman)hastheresponsibilityof advisingacomplainantof the
decisionof theTribunal in anydisciplinaryproceedingarisingfrom the complaints.
Thisprocedurehasbeeninconvenientin practicewherethe complaintwas madeto the
Ombudsman,asthe Ombudsmanis not directly involvedin disciplinaryproceedings.

For theabovereason,clause17 insertsnewsubsections67(9)and(10), with two
effects. First, the old subsection(9) issplit into two partsfor thesakeof clarity.
Secondly,theprovisionis amendedto providefor all complainantsto be advisedof
thedecisionof theDisciplinaryTribunalby the Commissionerratherthanthe
Ombudsman.

Clause17 alsoamendssubsection67(1)to accountfor theOmbudsman’sownmotion
investigationsunderproposedsection21Aandfor proposedsection52A regarding
undisputedcharges.

Section67 is alsoamendedto extendto chargesagainstall AFP appointees,and
introducesgender-neutrallanguage,in accordancewith changesmadeelsewherein
this Bill.

Clause18: Powersof Tribunal

Subsection71(2) of thePrincipalActgivespowerto theDisciplinaryTribunalof its
ownmotion,or attherequestof apartyto the proceeding,to summonapersonto
appearbeforethe Tribunalto giveevidenceandtoproduceanydocumentreferredto
in thesummons.
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At present,asummonsissuedundersubsection71(2) mustbesignedby theRegistrar
or a DeputyRegistrarof theTribunal. Clause18amendsthisto permittheissueof a
summonssignedby amemberof theTribunalas analternativeto signatureby the
Registraror DeputyRegistrar.Thiswill avoidunnecessarydelayswherethe Tribunal
sitsoutof normalhoursor in acity wherethereis no registraror deputyregistrar.

Clause19: Offenceof victimisation

Clause19 insertsinto thePrincipalActanewsection88A whichcreatesanoffenceof
causingor threateningtocausedetrimentto aperson(‘thevictim’) on thegroundthat
thevictim, or anyotherperson(including amemberof theInvestigationDivision) has
madeor mightmakeacomplaintor hasgivenor mightgiveadocumentor other
informationto assistin an investigationunderthePrincipalAct

Thisprovisionis designedto protectcomplainantsandthose(includingpolice) who
assistin investigations,againstthepossibilityof policevictimisation. It is appropriate
thatthisprovisionandthe newsection19 (insertedby clause6 of this Bill) be
introducedsimultaneouslysothat thenew offencesof giving falseinformationandof
victimisationmaybalanceeachotherandtherebycutdownthe potentialfor abuse.

Clause20: TransitionalProvision

Clause20 ensuresthatthesecrecyprovisionof thePrincipalAct (section87)

continuesto applyto thosepersonsit appliedto beforethecommencementof this Act.

Clause21: Otheramendmentsto extendapplicationof Complaints(Australian

FederalPolice)Act1981 toAEPappointees.

Theamendmentsproposedin clause21 areset outin scheduleI of this Bill. They
extendtheapplicationof thePrincipalAct to all employeesof the AFP whofall within
thedefinition of ‘AFP appointee’in clause2 of this Bill.

Clause22: Otheramendmentsto introducegender-neutraltenninologyin the
Complaints(AustralianFederalPolice)Act1981

The amendmentsproposedin clause22 aresetoutin schedule2 of thisBill. Theyare
intendedto removesexistterminologyfrom thePrincipalAct in accordancewith
currentdraftingpractice.

Clause23: Otheramendmentsto penalties

The penaltiessetout in thePrincipalAct areno longerin accordancewith criminal
law policy. Theamendmentsproposedin clause23 aredesignedtorectify this
situationandare setout in schedule3 of this Bill.
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