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CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT
BILL (NO.5)1997

OUTLINE E
The purposeof thebill is to altercertain
provisionsof theCustomsTariff Act which deal
with thetariff on textiles,clothingandfootwear.

At presenttheAct providesfor aprogressive
reductionin certainratesoftariff until 2000. They
containno provisionsasto how longthoserates
will apply.

Thepurposeof this bill is to providealevel of
certaintyto bothemployersandemployeesin
Australia’stextile, clothing andfootwear
industriesby providingthat thetariffs should
remainatthelevelsreachedby 1 July 2000.

This measureis akey elementin thefuture
developmentofAustralia’stextiles,clothingand
footwearindustry.It will allow theindustries
somedegreeof stability sothattheycan
consolidateovertheperiodto theyear2005.
LaborPartypolicy providesthatacomprehensive
reviewof the industry’spositionbeundertakenin
2004,andthe retentionof theimport credit
scheme,modifiedasnecessarywith our
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internationaltradingobligations,sothatdecisions
canthenbemadein light of this reviewasto the
appropriatelevel of tariffs to apply from 1 January
2005.



CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT
BILL (NO.5)1997

NOTES ON SECTIONS

Section1 — Short title — CustomsTariff
AmendmentBill (No. 5)1997.

Section2 — Commencement— Thesection
providesfor theAct to commenceon theday on
which it receivestheRoyalAssent.

Section3 — Schedules— This section
providesthattheCustomsTariff Act 1995is
amendedassetout in Schedule1.

Schedule1 — Theitems in thescheduleall
providethatwhateverratesof tariff applyingat 1
July2000will continueto applyuntil atleast31
December2004.
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