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WET TROPICS OF QUEENSLAND WORLD HERITAGE AREA
CONSERVATION BILL 1993

GENERAL OUTLINE 4
The purposeof this Bill is to bring into effectpermanentmanagement
arrangements,whicharesetout in theAgreementmadebetweenthe
CommonwealthandQueenslandon 16 November1990,andareincorporated
into the Wet TropicsWorldHeritage ProtectionandManagementAct1993 (Qid)
asSchedule1. The arrangementsimplementtheCommonwealth’s
internationalobligationsfor theprotectionof theWetTropicsof Queensland
World HeritagePropertyundertheConventionfor the Protectionofthe World
Cultural andNatural Heritage (theWorld HeritageConvention).

FINANCIAL IMPACT STATEMENT

TheBill hasno financialimplications.



NOTES ON CLAUSES

ClauseI - Short Title

1. Thisclauseprovidesfor theAct to becited as theWetTropicsofQueensland

WorldHeritageArea ConservationAct7993.

Clause2- Contmencement

2. This clauseprovidesthattheAct shallcomeinto operationon thedayit
receivestheRoyal Assent.

Clause3 - Object of the Act

3. This clausemakescleartheobjectof theAct is to giveeffect to the
Agreement between the Commonwealth and Queensland on the conservation
of theWet Tropicsof QueenslandWorld HeritageArea.

Clause4-Definitions

4. Thisclauseprovidesthatthe definitionof “Authority” is consistentwith
thatin theQueenslandAct anddefinesrrQueenslandAct’ asbeingthe Wet
TropicsofQueenslandWorldHeritageAreaConservationAct1993.

Clause5 - Nomination of membersof the board of the Wet Tropics
ManagementAuthority

5. This clausepermitstheMinister to nominatetwo personsto be appointed
to theBoardof Directorsof theWet TropicsManagementAuthority in
accordancewith section14 (b) of theQueenslandAct.

Clause6 - Secondmentof staff to Authority

6. Thisclausepermitsthe Minister to makearrangementsfor theservicesof
officersandemployeesof theAustralianPublicServiceandstaffof
Commonwealthauthoritiesto be madeavailableto the Authority. This
provision iscomplementaryto section32 of theQueenslandAct.

Clause7- Operation of World Heritage PropertiesConservationAct

7. Thisclauseprovidesthatnothingin the Act is intendedto affectthe
operationof theWorldHeritage PropertiesConservationAct 1983. The purpose
of thisprovisionis to ensurethat theMinister’s responsibilitiesunderthatAct
arenot abrogated.



Clause8-Tabling of annual report of Authority

8. Subclause8(1) defines“armual report” in termsof section63 of the
QueenslandActwhich requirestheAuthority to provide the Minister and the
Commonwealthwith a reporton the administrationof theQueenslandAct, 4
financialstatementsfor theyearandthestateof theWetTropicsAreawithin
threemonthsof theendof eachfinancialyear.

Subclause8 (2) providesthattheMinistermusttabletheannualreport in
eachHouseof theParliamentwithin 15 sitting daysof thatHouseafterthe
reporthasbeenreceived.
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