
1983 Wrest Point Casino Licence and Development No. 41 
Amendment 

WREST POINT CASINO LICENCE AND DE,VELOPMENT 
AMENDMENT ACT 1983 

No. 41 of 1983 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 

1. Short ltitle. 
2. Commencement. 
3. Principal Act. 
4. Amendment of section 7 of Principal Act (Power of 

Treasurer to guarantee certain loans to company). 

AN ACT to amend the Wrest Point Casino Licence and Development 
Act 1968. 

[Royal Assent 22 September 1983] 

BE it enacted by His Excellency the Governor of Tasmania, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council, and 

House of Assembly, in Parliament assembled, as follows:-

1-This Act may be cited as the Wrest Point Casino Licence and Short title. 

Development Amendment Act 1983. 

271 



272 

Commence· 
ment. 

Principal Act. 

Amendment of 
section 7 of 
Principal Act 
(Power of 
Treasurer to 
guarantee 
certain loans 
to company). 

No. 41 Wrest Point Casino Licence and Development 1983 
Amendment 

2-( 1) This section and section 1 shall commence on the day 
on which this Act receives the royal assent. . 

( 2) Except as provided in subsection (1), this Act shall com­
mence on a day to be fixed by proclamation. 

3-1n this Act, the Wrest Point Casino Licence and Development 
Act 1968* is referred to as the Principal Act. 

4-( 1) Section 7 (4) of the Principal Act is amended by 
omitting " $11 000 000 " and substituting " $19 000 000 ". 

( 2) Section 7 (7) of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" $11 000 000 " and substituting " $19 000 000 ". 

* No. 78 of 1968. Amended by No. 21 of 1973, No. 89 of 1974, No. 69 of 1976, No. 30 of 1981, and 
No. 28 of 1982, and affected by No. 29 of 1970, No. 32 of 1973, and No. 55 of 1975. 


