
1 9 6 5 553" 

V I C T O R I A . 

ANNO QUARTO DfiCIMO 

ELIZABETHS SECUNDS REGINS 

No. 7332. 

An Act to revise the Statute Law. 

[Uth December, 1965.] 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Counol and 

the Legislative Assembly of Victoria in this present Parliament 
assembled and by the authority of the same as follows (that is 
to say) ;— 

1. This Act may be cited as the Statute Law Revision Act short uue. 
1965. 

2. The Acts mentioned in the First Schedule to this Act to Acts to be 
' the extent to which they are in and by that Schedule expressed replied. "^ 
to be amended or repealed are hereby amended or repealed Kret schedule. 
accordingly. 

3. This Act shall, to the extent that it amends or repeals by 
reference to the First Schedule to this Act the Public Lands and 
Works Act 1964, be deemed to have come into operation on the 
15th day of March, 1965, and to the extent that it amends by 
reference to item 71 of the First Schedule to this Act the Local 
Government Act 1958, be deemed to have come into operation 
on the 1st day of March, 1963. 

4. The Acts mentioned in the Second Schedule to this Act Acts spent in 

1o the extent to which they are in and by that Schedule expressed be^pealed. 

to be repealed are hereby repealed accordingly. iSSie 

SCHEDULES. 



554 1965. Statute Law Revision. No. 7332 

SCHEDULES. 

FIRST SCHEDULE. 

Item. 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

No. 
of 
Act. 

6191 

• > 

»• 

»> 

»» 

>» 

6202 

»» 

6209 

6210 

6225 

»» 

>» 

6226 

99 

»> 

6229 

Title of Act. Extent of AiDCDdment or Repeal. 

Administration and 
Probate Act 1958 

> t »> »» 

Auction Sales Act 1958 

Boilers Inspection Act 
J 958 

Building Societies Act 
1958 

Co-operation Act 1958 

Co-operative Housing 
Societies Act 1958 

»f tt 

i > >» 

Country Roads Act 
1958 

In section 1 the expression^ 
" Part V.—^Duties on Deceased Person's Estates 

ss. 100-137." shall be repealed. 
In section 19 for the word " i f" there shall be substituted 

the word " i t " . 
In section 37 for the expression " Part V. of this Ac t " 

there shall be substituted the expression " the Probate 
Duty Act 1962 ". 

In sub-section (3) of section 39 for the expression 
" sections one hundred and twenty and one hundred 
and twenty-one relating to the payment of duty under 

^ Part V. of this Act" there shall be substituted the 
following expression :— 

" the Probate Duty Act 1962 ". 
In section 74 for the words " registrar of the County 

Court" there shall be substituted the words " registrar 
of probates and administrations or such clerk of petty 
sessions ". 

In paragraph (b) of section 86 for the expression " Part 
V." there shall be substituted the expression " the 
Probate Duty Act 1962 ". 

In sub-section (2) of section 3 for the expression " Board 
of Land and Works" there shall be substituted the 
expression " Minister of Lands or the Minister of 
Public Works ". 

In section 38 for the expression " possesed " there shall be 
, substituted the word " possessed ". 
In paragraph (g) of section 25 after the word " reference " 

there shall be inserted the word "shal l" . 
In section 15 before the words "Two or more persons" 

there shall be'inserted the expression " ( 1 ) " . 
In section 1 for the expression "Associations and Unions 

ss. 21-27." there shall be substituted the expression 
"Associations and Unions ss. 22-27 ". 

In paragraph (c) of sub-section (1) of section 19 the word 
" the " (where first occurring) shall be repealed. 

For paragraph (b) of sub-section (13) of section 69 there 
shall be substituted the following paragraph :— 

" (b) if he becomes of unsound mind or becomes 
a patient within the meaning of the Mental 
Health Act 1959 ; ". 

In sub-paragraph (iii) of paragraph (a) of sub-section 
(1) of section 5 after the expression " dwelling-house ; " 
there shall be inserted the word " or ". 

In sub-paragraph (iiia) of paragraph (a) of sub-section 
(1) of section 5 after the expression " dwelling-house ; " 
there shall be inserted the word " or ". 

For paragraph (.b) of sub-section (11) of section forty-eight 
there shall be substituted the following paragraph :— 

" (b) if he becomes of unsound mind or becomes a 
patient within the meaning of the Mental 
Health Act 1959 ; ". 

In sections 85 and 91 for the words " Commissioner of 
Crown Lands and Survey " there shall be substituted 
the words " Minister of Lands ". 

FmsT 



1965 Statute Law Revision. No. 7332 555 

FIRST SCHEDULE—continued. 

Item. Title of Act. Extent of Amendment or RepeaL 

18 6231 Crimes Act 1958 

19 

20 
21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

6245 

6254 

6262 

6270 

6274 

»» ft r* 

» »» 91 

»» t » . » 

Estate Agents Act 1958 

Forests Act 1958 

Geelong Harbor Trust 
Act 1958 

Health Act 1958 

Hospitals and Charities 
Act 1958 

For sub-section (1) of section 54 there shall be substituted 
the following sub-section :—• 

" (1) Whosoever being— 
(a) a superintendent deputy-superintendent medical 

practitioner medical officer medical attendant 
officer nurse attendant or other person 
employed in any institution within the 
meaning of the Mental Health Act 1959 
or a benevolent asylum or charitable 
institution ; or 

(6) a person having the care or charge of any 
female being a patient within the meaning -
of the Mental Health Act 1959 or 
intellectually defective within the meaning 
of that A c t -

carnally knows or attempts or assaults with intent to 
carnally know that female or any female imder care 
treatment supervision or control as a person who 
is mentally ill or intellectually defective in any 
institution within the meaning of the Mental Health 
Act 1959 or a benevolent asylum or charitable 
institution shall be guilty of a misdemeanour, and 
shall be liable to imprisonment for a term of not more 
than five years and no consent or alleged consent of 
the female shall be a defence to any charge for the 
oflFence." 

In sub-section (4) of section 319 of the Crimes Act 1958 
for the expression ' " drug" means any narcotic or 
dangerous drug within the meaning of the Poisons Act 
1958 ' there shall be substituted the expression ' " drug " 
means any drug of addiction or specified drug within 
the meaning of the Poisons Act 1962.' 

In section 503 the second paragraph shall be repealed. 
In sub-section four of section 533 for the word " Director " 

there shall be substituted the expression " Director- • 
General". 

In sub-paragraph (ii) of paragraph (a) of sub-section (2) 
of section 4, for the words " the final paragraph of" 
there shall be substituted the words " sub-section (2) 
of". 

In sub-section (3) of section 94A for the expression " (c) " 
(where second occurring) there shall be substituted the 
expression " (e) ". 

In sub-section (3) of section 44 for the words " the the 
Minister " (wherever occurring) there shall be substituted 
the words "the Minister". 

In sub-paragraph (iv) of paragraph (d) of sub-section 
(1) of section 66 for the words " National Gas 
Association of Australia " there shall be substituted the 
words "AustraUan Gas Association". 

In the Second Schedule under the heading 
" INCORPORATED INSTITUTIONS "— 

(a) for item 52 there shall be substituted the 
following item :— 

" 52 The Geelong and Western District 
Ladies Benevolent Association.'* ; 

(b) for item 60 there shall be substituted the 
following item :— 

" 60 Grace McKellar House—Geelong." ; 
(c) for item 89 there shall be substituted the 

following item :— 
" 89 The Menzies Homes for Children." ; 

Fasi 



556 1965. Statute Law Revision. No. 7332 

FIRST SCHEDULE—continued. 

Item. 

26 

27 

28 

29 

30 

31 

32 

33 

34 

35 

36 

37 

38 

39 

40 

41 

42 

No. 
of 
Act. 

6274 

6282 

» 

. >• 

6283 

9» 

6284 

U 

*f 

»r 

)f 

f» 

9> 

*9 

»f 

»> 

» 

Title of Ad. Extent of Amendment or Repeal. 

Hospitals and Charities 
Act 1958—continued. 

Justices Act 1958 

f > tt 99 

»» >» »» 

Labour and Industry 
Act 1958 

t » >» » 

£<i/u/ ^cf 1958 

f f >» 

> f i » 

9> f* 

» »f 

t» •> 

• • •• 

(<0 for item 99 there shall be substituted the 
following item :— 

" 99 Norah Cosgrave Terang and District 
Commimity Hospital." ; 

(e) for item 118 there shall be substituted the 
following item :— 

"118 The Royal Melbourne Hospital."; 
(/) for item 128 there shall be substituted the 

following item :— 
" 128 Southern Memorial Hospital, 

Brighton." 

In Form 3 of the Second Schedule for the words " There 
are therefore" there shall be substituted the words 
" These are therefore ". 

In Form 59 of the Second Schedule for the words " on 
this behalf" there shall be substituted the words " in 
this behalf". 

In Form 59 of the Second Schedule for the expression 
" [there to be kept for hard labour] *' there shall be 
substituted the expression " [there to be kept to hard 
labour]". 

In sub-section (3) of section 51 for the expression " Town 
and Country Planning Act 1958 " there shall be substituted 
the expression " Town and Country Planning Act\96\ ". 

In sub-section (2) of section 123 for the words " where 
is appears" there shall be substituted the words 
" where it appears ". 

In paragraph (d) of section 40 before the expression " four 
A land " there shall be inserted the word " class ". 

In sub-section (3) of section 50 for the words " under 
the seal of the Board " there shall Oe substituted the 
words " signed by the Minister ". 

In paragraph (g) of section 70 for the words " it may 
by writing under its seal" there shall be substituted 
the words " the Minister may by writing under his 
htod ". 

In sub-section (1) of section 74 for the words " give its 
consent" there shall be substituted the words " give 
his consent". 

In section 119 for the words " as it thinks fit" there shall 
be substituted the words " as he thinks fit". 

In sub-section (3) of section 131 for the words " by by " 
there shall be substituted the word " by ". 

In section 151A in the interpretation of " plantation area " 
for the word " Board " there shall be substituted the 
word " Minister ". 

In section 156 for the words " it thinks fit" there shall 
be substituted the words " the Minister thinks fit". 

In paragraph (d) of sub-section (5) of section 251 for 
the word " Board " there shall be substituted the word 
" Minister ". 

In sub-section (1) of section 254 for the words " if it 
considers " there shall be substituted the words " if he 
considers ". 

In paragraphs (a) and (b) of sub-section (4) of section 259 
for the words "it thinks fit" there shall be substituted 
the words " he thinks fit". 

FIRST 



1965. Statute Law Revision. No. 7332 557 

FmsT SCHEDULE—continued. 

Item. 

43 

44 

45 

46 

47 

48 

49 

50 

51 

52 

53 

54 

55 

56 

57 

58 

59 

60 

No. 
of 
Act. 

6284 

ft 

»l 

f> 

»» 

l> 

*» 

fl 

6285 

f> 

6286 

>» 

>» 

6289 

If 

6290 

6299 

fl 

Title of Act. Extent of Amendment or Repeal. 

Land Act 1958—con
tinued. 
II ff 

»i If 

If ff 

II II 

fl >i 

II ff 

Landlord and Tenant 
Act 1958 

>t f l 

Lands Compensation 
Act 1958 

I I f f 

Land Tax Act 1958 . . 

>9 I * 

Latrobe Valley Act 
1958 

Local Government Act 
1958 

>• »> 

In sub-section (2) of section 264B for the word " its" 
there shall be substituted the word " his ". 

In sub-section (2) of section 313 for the words " the the " 
there shall be substituted the word " the ". 

In sub-section (1) of section 314 for the words "Land 
Classification Minister " (wherever occurring) there shall 
be substituted the words " Land Classification Board ". 

In sub-section (1) of section 314 for the word " Minister " 
(where first occurring) there shall be substituted the 
words " Board of Land and Works or the Minister ". 

For section 333 there shall be substituted the following 
section :— 

" 333. (1) All lands taken under the authority of 
this Part by the Minister of Public Works shall be 
conveyed or transferred to Her Majesty her heirs 
and successors, and shall not be alienated in fee 
simple by her or her successors without the express 
authority of an Act of Parliament passed in that 
behalf. 

(2) Where a piece of land taken under the authority 
of this Part for any purpose is found to exceed the 
area required for that purpose, the part or parts 
thereof which are in excess may if the Governor in 
Council so determines, be dealt with as unalienated 
land of the Crown." 

In sub-section (1) of section 351 for the words." it may 
in its discretion " there shall be substituted the words 
"he may in his discretion". 

In the Eighth Schedule for the words " said Board of 
Land and Works " there shall be substituted the words 
" Minister of Lands ". 

In the Eighth Schedule for the word " is " (where, first 
occurring) there shall be substituted the word " it". 

In section 4 for the word " profit" there shall be substituted 
the word " profits ". 

In paragraph 10 of Column 2 of the Third Schedule for 
the words " yield up into " there shall be substituted 
the words " yield up unto ". 

In sub-section (2) of section 63 for the words " of its 
intention to exercise its powers" there shall be substituted 
the words " of his intention to exercise his powers ". 

In sub-sections (2) and (4) of section 63 for the word 
" its " (wherever occurring) there shall be substituted 
the word " his ". 

In sub-section (3) of section 63 for the word " it" there 
shall be substituted the word " he". 

In section 3 the interpretation of " Assessment Court" 
shall be repealed. 

In section 11 before the words " Where land is owned 
I by a mutual life assurance society all the profits of 

which " there shall be inserted the expression " (1)". 
In section 12 before the words " Notwithstanding 

anything " there shall be inserted the expression " (1)". 
In section 1 for the word " Part" (where first occurring) 

there shall be substituted the word " Parts ". 
In section 1 for the expression— 

" Division 2.—Manner of making— 
{a\ Generally, ss. 204-210 ; 
{b) Regulations of Governor in Council, s. 211." 

there shall be substituted the expression— 
" Division 2.—Manner of making—ss. 204-210." 

FIRST 



558 1965. Statute Law Revision. No. 7332 

Fmsr SCHEDULE—continued. 

Item. 

61 

62 

63 

64 

65 

66 

67 

68 

69 

70 

71 

72 

73 

74 

75 
76 

No. 
of 
Act. 

6299 

») 

>» 

*• 

9> 

1) 

>* 

9> 

f> 

» 

»> 

• » 

>> 

»» 

Title of Act. 

Local Government Act 
1958—continued. 

Extent of Amendment or Repeal. 

In section 1 for the expression— 
" (1) Declaration of Alignment of Streets, ss. 607-619." 

there shall be substituted the expression— 
"(1) Declaration of Alignment of Streets, ss. 

606-619." 
In section 1 for the expression— 

" Inspection of Scaffolding, ss. 824-833." 
there shall be substituted the expression— 

" Inspection of Scaffolding, ss. 824-833C." 
In paragraph (a) of section 73 after the words " One 

hundred " (where first occurring) there shall be inserted 
the word " pounds ". 

The sub-heading— 
" (a) Generally." preceding section 204 and the sub

heading— 
" {b) Regulations of Governor in Council." following 

section 210 shall be repealed. 
In paragraph (6) of section 287 for the word " are" 

there shall be substituted the word " is ". 
In sub-section (1) of section 301 for the word " date" 

there shall be substituted the word " rate ". 
In paragraph (a) of section 338 for the expression " two 

hundred and fifty-five" there shall be substituted the 
expression " two hundred and fifty-four ". 

In the proviso to sub-section (2) of section 386 for the 
word " payble" there shall be substituted the word 
" payable . 

In sub-para^aph (iii) of paragraph (b) of sub-section 
(1) of section 388 for the expression " three hundred 
and seventy-eight" there shall be substituted the 
the expression " three hundred and seventy-seven ". 

In the proviso to section 506 for the words " Commissioner 
of Crown Lands and Survey " there shall be substituted 
the words " Minister of Lands ". 

In sub-section (1) of section 519 for the expression beginning 
with the words "delineating that street road lane or 
passage " and ending at the end of the sub-section there 
shall be substituted the following expression :— 

" of subdivision delineating that street road lane or 
passage has been seded with the seal of the 
municipality under subdivision (3) of Division 9 
of Part XIX. of the Local Government Act 1958, 
or a corresponding previous enactment." 

In sub-paragraph (ii) of paragraph (o) of sub-section (7) 
of section 569B for the expression " 1961 " there shall 
be substituted the expression " 1958 ". 

In sub-section (4) of section 569D for the expression 
" the last preceding sub-section" there shall be 
substituted the expression " sub-section (3) ". 

For sub-section (3) of section 696 there shall be substituted 
the following sub-section :— 

"(3), Regulations made under this section shall 
take effect from the date on which notice of their 
making is published in the Government Gazette or 
from such later date as is specified in the regulations ". 

Sub-section (2) of section 755 shall be repealed. 
In the Twenty-second Schedule for the expression " Where 

the land is not under the Transfer of Land Act 1958— " 
(where first occurring) there shall be substituted the 
expression " Where the land is under the Transfer of 
Land Act 1958—". 

FiRSI 



1965. Statute Law Revision. No. 7332 559 

FIRST SCHEDULE—continued. 

Item. 

77 

78 

79 

80 

81 

82 

83 

No. 
of 

Act 

6302 

•> 

f t 

i » 

> i 

f> 

M 

Title of Act. 

Marine Act 1958 . . 

. 

» 9t 99 

tf f» » 

>> >f 9f 

f> •* » 

»» » »» 

f» *f 39 

Extent of Amendment or Repeal. 

In section 1 for the expression— 
" Part VII.— 

Investigations 
and Inquiries 

Division 1.—Application ss. 
174. 

Division 2.—Casualties &c. 
ss. 175-177. 

into Casualties •{ Division 3. — Preliminary 
Incompetency 
and Misconduct 

Inquiries. Investigations ss. 
178-182. 

Division 4.—Court of Marine 
Inquiry ss. 183-197." 

there shall be substituted the expression— 
" Part VII.— 

Investigations 
and Inquiries 
into Casualties 
Incompetency 
and Misconduct 

'Division 1.—Application and 
Interpretation ss. 174, 175. 

Division 2.—Court of Marine 
Inquiry ss. 176-186. 

Division 3.—Casualties, &c. 
ss. 187-189. 

Division 4. — Preliminary 
Inquiries—Investigations ss. 
190-196." 

In section 1 the expression— 

" Part Vm.— 
Passengers 

Division 1.—Passage Brokers 
and Emigrant Runners ss. 
198-212. 

Division 2.—^Provisions for 
Health and Safety of 
Passengers ss. 213-215. 

Division 3.—Landing of Pas
sengers ss. 216-228. 

Division 4. — Bonds for 
Support of Imbecile 

, Immigrants ss. 229-232." 
shall be repealed. 

In section 1 for the expression " Part IX.—Miscellaneous 
ss. 233-262." there shall be substituted the expression— 
" Part IX.—MisceUaneous ss. 237-247 ; 251-259 ; 

261." 
In section 1 for the expression " Part X.—Commonwealth 

Navigation Act and possible Transfer of Powers, &c. 
ss. 263-268." there shall be substituted the expression— 

"Part X.—Commonwealth Navigation Act and 
possible Transfer of Powers, &c. ss. 262-267." 

In sub-section (5) of section 261 for the words " the Board 
of Land and Works" there shall be substituted the 
words " the Minister of Public Works ". 

In item 7 under the sub-heading— 
"(6) Vessels towed by Steam" 

of the Fourth Schedule for the word "enchorage" 
there shall be substituted the word " anchorage ". 

In the Fourth Schedule in the paragraph under the 
heading— 

" EXEMPTIONS "— 
(a) after the words " of Victoria and " there shall 

be inserted the words " any port" ; and 
(6) for the words " New Zealand and " there shall 

be substituted 1 he words " New Zealand or ". 

FIRST 



560 1965. Statute Law Revision. No. 7332 

FiRST SCHEDULE—continued. 

Item. 

84 

85 

86 

87 

88 

89 

90 

91 

92 

93 

94 

95 

96 

97 

98 

99 

100 

No. 
of 
Act. 

6309 

>l 

)• 

6310 

»» 

• • 

l» 

6318 

»> 

» 

6331 

6338 

«> 

6349 

6359 

» 

6366 

Title of Act. 

Medical Act 1958 

I f f> 

i> » 

Melbourne and Metro
politan Board of 
Works Act 1958 

>» 99 

» »> 
Af///t Soarrf /4c/ 1958 

ty ti •• 

Patriotic Funds Act 
1958 

Police Regulation Act 
' 1958 

« • »» 9» 

Public Service Act 1958 

/?£>arf Traffic Act 1958 

Servants Registry 
Offices Act 1958 

Extent of Amendment or Repeal. 

For paragraph (a) of sub-section (1) of section 12A there 
shall be substituted the following paragraph :— 

" (a) is a patient within the meaning of the' Mental 
Health Act 1959 ; or ". 

For sub-section (5) of section 12A there shall be substituted 
the following sub-section :— 

" (5) The secretary of a psychiatric hospital mental 
hospital or'repatriation mental hospital or the licensee 
of a private mental home shall notify the Board 
forthwith if a person known by him to be registered 
as a legally qualified medical practitioner is admitted 
to the psychiatric hospital mental hospital repatriation 
mental hospital or private mental home". 

In section 31 for the words " the Director of Penal 
Services the chief, medical oflBcer of the Mental Hygiene 
Authority" there shall be substituted the expression 
" the Director-General of Social Welfare the chief 
medical officer of the Mental Health Authority " . 

In section 179 before the words "Any officer of the Board " 
there shall be inserted the expression " (1)". 

In paragraph (1) of the Tenth Schedule for the words 
" one months" there shall be substituted the words 
" one month ". 

In the Thirteenth Schedule for the expression 
" commencemnt" there shall be substituted the word 
"commencement". 

In the Thirteenth Schedule for the expression " fourten " 
there shall be substituted the word "fourteen". 

In paragraph ( / ) of sub-section (1) of section 42 for the 
word " form" there shall be substituted -the word 
" forms " . 

In paragraph ( / ) of sub-section (1) of section 42 the word 
" and " (where second^ occurring) is hereby repealed. 

In paragraph {fa) of sub-section (1) of section 42 after 
the expression " machines ; " there shall be inserted 
the word " and " . 

In section 23 before the words "Any person who without 
the sanction in writing" there shall be inserted the 
expression " (1)". 

In sub-section (2) of section 60 after the words " For 
the purposes " there shall be inserted the word " of'-'. 

In section 65 for the words "may remove" there shall 
be substituted the words " may be removed ". 

In the Third Schedule the words " or as a justice of the 
peace for the State of Victoria or the city town or 
district or municipal district" are repealed. 

In paragraph (rf) of sub-section (1) of section 7 the word 
" or " (where second occurring) is hereby repealed. 

In paragraph ( / ) of section 7 after the expression "control 
of the Commissioners ; " there shall be inserted the 
word " o r " . 

In section 11 after the word " Secretary' 
inserted the word " or " . 

there shall be 

FIRST 



1965. Statute Law Revision. No. 7332 561 

FIRST SCHEDIJLE—continued. 

Item. 

101 

102 

103 

104 

105 

106 

107 

108 

109 

110 

No. 
of 
Act. 

6368 

f> 

6372 

*» 

6375 

*» 

f) 

it 

»> 

6386 

Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repea!. 

Sewerage Districts Act 
1958 

» l l » 

111 

112 

113 

114 

115 

6390 

6399 

l> 

6401 

• > 

Soil Conservation and 
Land Utilization Act 
1958 

Stamps Act 1958 

»» i » »> 

t> I I t i 

I I I I 

Superannuation Act 
1958 

Tattersall Consultations 
Act 1958 

Transfer of Land Act 
1958 

Trustee Act 1958 

In paragraph (6) of sub-section (1) of section 80A for the 
words " to be rated to " there shall be substituted the 
words " to be rated by ". 

In sub-section (2) of section 80A for the words " to be 
rated t o " (where twice occurring) there shall be 
substituted the words " to be rated by ". 

In paragraph (d) of sub-section (2) of section 15 after 
the words "The Governor in Council may from" 
there shall be inserted the word " time ". 

In paragraph (c) of sub-section (4) of section 24E for the 
words " competent- court of jurisdiction " there shall 
be substituted the words "court of competent 
jurisdiction ". 

In sub-section (2) of section 9 for the words " impressed 
of affixed" there shall be substituted the words 
" impressed or affixed ". 

In sub-section (1) of section 114 for the words " certificate 
in the the manner prescribed " there shall be substituted 
the words " certificate in the manner prescribed ". 

In sub-section (3) of section 77 after the words " any 
provision in a lease" there shall be inserted the word 
" the ". 

In sub-section (2) of section 1 3 1 D for the words "this 
sub-section " there shall be substituted the expression 
" sub-section (1) of this section ". 

In paragraph (2) of the exemptions under the heading 
"XIX. Instalment Purchase Agreement" in the Third 
Schedule after the expression " River Improvement Act 
1958" there shall be inserted the word " o r " . 

In section 39 for the expression " a lunatic or lunatic . 
patient within the meaning of the Mental Hygiene A ct 
1958" there shall be substituted the expression "a person 
who is of unsound mind or who is a patient within 
the meaning of the Mental Health Act 1959 ". 

For sub-paragraphs (i) and (iO of paragraph (b) of 
sub-section (3) of section 7 there shall be substituted 
the following paragraph :— 

" (i) the establishment and maintenance of institutions 
and day training centres within the meaning 
of the Mental Health Act 1959 ; 

(ii) the administration of the Mental Health Act 1959". 

In sub-section (2) of section 10 for the words " memorials 
or registration" there shall be substituted the words 
" memorials of registration ". 

In paragraph (c) of sub-section (3) of section 77 for the 
words "under on i n " there shall be substituted the 
words " under or in ". 

In sub-section (2) of section 24 for the words " costs or 
recovering " there shall be substituted the words " costs 
of recovering ". 

For sub-section (9) of section 41 there shall be substituted 
the following sub-section :— 

" (9) Where a person who is of unsound mind 
or who is within the meaning of the Public Trustee 
Act 1958 a patient or an infirm person is a trustee 
of property and is also entitled in possession to some 
beneficial interest in that properly no appointment 

FiRCT 



562 1965. Statute LuAf Revision. No. 7332 

FIRST SCHEDULE—coR/Aiueci 

Item. 

lis 

116 

117 

118 

119 

120 

121 

122 

123 

124 

125 

126 

127 

128 

129 

130 

131 

132 

No. 
of 
Act. 

6401 

6407 

6413 

>» 

t> 

>» 

>l 

6414 

S» 

6419 

6605 

»» 

»» 

6839 

9» 

*l 

6847 

*f 

Title of Act. Extent of Amendment or RepeaL 

Trustee Act 1958-
continued. 

Vegetation and Vine 
Diseases Act 1958 

Water Act 1958 

f f f » 

»» »f 

Weights and Measures 
Act 1958 

Workers Compensation 
Act 1958 

Mental Health Act 
1959 

Companies Act 1961 

» »> 

Marine {Amendment) 
Act 1961 

of a new trustee in his place shall be made by the 
continuing trustees or trustee under this section 
unless leave has been given— 

(a) in the case of a person who is of unsound 
mind— 

by the Court ; or 
{b) in the case of a patient or infirm person— 

by the Court or by the Public Trustee." 
In paragraph (c) of sub-section (1) of section 26 for the 

words " such trees" there shall be substituted the 
words " such trees and plants ". 

In paragraph (6) of sub-section (2) of section 65A for the 
words " opinion of Commission" there shall be 
substituted the words " opinion of the Commission ". 

In subrsection (5) of section 233 for the words " sealed 
with the seal of the Board of Land and Works" 
there shall be substituted the words " signed by the 
Minister of Lands ". 

In the fourth paragraph of section 289 for the expression 
" oustanding" there shall be substituted the word 
" outstanding ". 

In sub-section (4) of section 403 for the word " Board " 
(where twice occurring) there shall be substituted the 
words " Minister of Public Works". 

In Schedule Eleven A for the expression " under the Water 
Acts 1958" there shall be substituted the expression 
" under the Water Act 1958 ". 

In sub-section (1) of section 3 in the interpretation of 
" Government Department" for the words " Board 
of Land and Works" there shall te substituted the 
words " Railway Construction Board ". 

In paragraph (c) of sub-section (7) of section 81 for the 
expression " fradulent" there shall be substituted 
the word " fraudulent". 

In paragraph (e) of sub-section (1) of section 74 for the 
expression " compension" there shall be substituted 
the word " compensation ". 

In sub-section (7) of section 15 for the word " power " 
there shall be substituted the word "powers". 

In sub-section (4) of section 33 for the word " section " 
there shall be substituted the word "Division". 

In sub-section (2) of section 87 for the words " he last" 
there shall be substituted the words "the last". 

In sub-section (1) of section 243 for the expression 
" preceedings" there shall be substituted the word 
" proceedings ". 

In sub-section (1) of section 348 for the word " that" 
(where first occurriog) there shall be substituted the 
word " than ". 

In Regulation 1 of Table A of the Fourth Schedule for 
the expression ' " State" means the State of * 
there shall be substituted the expression '" State" 
means the State of Victoria'. 

In paragraph (d) of section 4 for the words " in any port 
of Victoria" there shall be substituted the words "in 
any port in Victoria". 

In paragraph (n) of section 6 for the words " home-trade 
ship whether British of foreign " there shall be substituted 
the words " home-trade ship whether British or 
foreign ". 

FIRST 



1965. Statute Law Revision. No. 7332 563 

FiRsr SCHEDULE—continued. 

Item. Title of Act. Extent of Amendmeot or Repeal. 

133 

134 

135 

136 

137 

138 

139 

140 

141 

142 

6888 

6890 

6916 

7010 

7091 

7122 

7168 

7228 

Local Government 
(Amendment) Act 
1962 

Probate Duty Act 1962 

Foreign Judgments 
Act 1962 

Housing {Contracts with 
Minors) Act 1963 

Door to Door (Sales) 
Act 1963 

Health (Child Minding) 
Act 1964 

Administration and 
Probate (Small 
Estates) Act 1964 

Public Lands and 
Works Act 1964 

143 

144 

145 

In paragraph (b) of section 22 for the words " appurtenances 
of the building" there shall be substituted the word 
" appurtenances of a building ". 

Sub-section (3) of section 29 shall be repealed. 

In paragraph (6) of sub-section (1) of section 4 for the 
words " Court of Sessions " there shall be substituted 
the words " Court of Session ". 

In section 2 for the expression " t h " there shall be 
substituted the word " the ". 

In section 3 for the word " owner" there shall be 
substituted the word " vendor ". 

In paragraph (c) of section 2 for the words "In the 
Eleventh Schedule" there shall be substituted the 
words " In paragraph (a) of the Eleventh Schedule ". 

In paragraph (c) of section 8 for the words " or the 
Commissioner" there shall be substituted the words 
" or Commissioner ". 

In paragraph (s) of Part XIX. of the Fourth Schedule 
for the words " Board of Lands and Works " there 
shall be substituted the words " Board of Land and 
Works ". 

In paragraph (ea) of Part XIX. of the Fourth Schedule 
after the expression ' " i t " ' there shall be inserted the 
expression " (where second occurring) ". 

For paragraph (ua) of Part XIX. of the Fourth Schedule 
there shall be substituted the following paragraph :— 

' (ua) In.section two himdred and nineteen— 
(i) in sub-section (1) for the words " has 

vested in trustees or jointly in the Board 
and trustees " there shall be substituted 
the words " which is vested in trustees 
or is vested or deemed to be vested 
jointly in the Minister and trustees " ; 

(ii) in paragraph (c) of sub-section (1) for the 
words " vested for recreation reserves 
in the council of the city of Melbourne 
either alone or jointly with the Board " 
there shall be substituted the words 
" vested for recreation reserves in the 
council of the city of Melbourne alone 
or granted by the Crown to or vested 
or deemed to be vested for recreation 
reserves in the council of the city of 
Melbourne jointly with either the Board 
of Land and Works or the Minister " ; 

(iii) in sub-section (6) for the expression 
" (including the Board) " there shall be 
substituted the expression " (including 
the Minister)".' 

In sub-paragraph (ii) of paragraph (ca) of Part XX. of 
the Fourth Schedule after the words " or deposit" 
there shall be inserted the expression "(where twice 
occurring) ". 

In sub-paragraph (iii) of paragraph (u) of Part XX. of 
the Fourth Schedule for the words " i t shall not be 
bound " there shall be substituted the words " it shall 
not be found " . 

Part XXDC of the Fourth Schedule shall be repealed. 

FIRST 



564 1965. Statute Law Revision. No. 7332 

FIRST SCHEDULE—continued. 

Item. 

146 

147 

148 

149 

150 

151 

152 

No. 
of 
Act. 

7228 

l» 

») 

7236 

i> 

7276 

7286 

TiUe of Act. Extent of Amendment or Repeal, 

Public Lands and 
Works Act 1964— 
continued. 

>> I f >f 

Shell {Corio to 
fVilliamstown) Pipe
lines Act 1964 

Valuation of Land 
(Appeals) Act 1965 

Local Government 
(Amendment) Act 
1965 

In paragraph (c) of Part XXVII. of the Fourth Schedule 
for the expression ' " the Board of Land and Works " 
and " the Board" * there shall be substituted the 
expression ' " The Board of Land and Worlcs" and 
the " Board " ' . 

For paragraph (i) of Part XLV. of the Fourth Schedule 
there shall be substituted the following paragraph :— 

" (i) In sub-section (5) of section two hundred and 
thirty-three for the words " sealed with the 
seal of the Board of Land and Works " there 
shall be substituted the words "signed by 
the Minister of Lands ". 

In paragraph (e) ~of Part II. of the Fifth Schedule after 
the expression " Board" there shall be inserted the 
expression " (where twice occurring) " . 

In sub-section (2) of section 5 for the word " be " there 
shall be substituted the word " by ". 

In sub-section (2) of section 8 for the expression ' " Board 
of Land and Works" or " Board " ' there shall be 
substituted the 
" Minister " 

expression '"Minister of Lands" or 

In paragraph (h) of section eight for the word " magistrate " 
there shall be substituted the word " magistrates " . 

In sub-section (3) of section 10 for the words " Division 
three" there shall be substituted the expression 
" Division 1 ". 

SECOND 



1965. Statute Law Revision. No. 7332 565 

SECOND SCHEDULE. 

No. 
of 

Act. 

.6564 

6577 
6605 
6651 
6705 

6831 
6846 

6886 
6917 
6968 

6975 
7081 
7145 
7228 

Title of Act. 

Registration of Births Deaths and 
Marriages Act 1959 

Lifts and Cranes Act 1959 , . . 
Mental Health Act 1959 
Social Welfare Act 1960 
Navigable Waters {Oil Pollution) 

Act 1960 
Companies Act 1961 
Rural Finance and Settlement 

Commission Act 1961 
Subordinate Legislation Act 1962 
Sale of Human Blood Act 1962.. 
Parliamentary Contributory 

Superannuation Act 1962 
Sale of Land Act 1962 
Superannuation Act 1963 
Litter Act 1964 
Public Lands and Works Act 1964 

Extent of Repeal. 

Part B of the First Schedule 

Sub-section (2) of section 2 
Sub-section (2) of section 2 and Second Schedule 
Part n. 
Section 2 

Parts n . and III. of the First Schedule 
Paragraph (e) of section 15 and the Schedule 

Section 3 and the Schedule 
Section 5 
Section 11 

Parts II. and III. 
Parts II. and III. 
Section 6 
Section 7 and the Fourth and Fifth Schedules 


