
328 

A N N O T R I C E S I M O S E C U N D O 

ELIZABETHAE SECUNDAE REGINAE 

VICTORIA 

Statute Law Revision Act 1983 

No. 9902 

An Act to revise the Statute Law of Victoria. 

[Assented to 15 June 1983] 

BE IT ENACTED by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 
the Legislative Assembly of Victoria in this present Parliament 
assembled and by the authority of the same as follows (that is to 
say): 

short Title. i t (i) This Act may be cited as the Statute Law Revision Act 1983. 

commence- (2) Subject to section 2 (2), this Act shall come into operation 
mem' on the day on which it receives the Roya l Assent. 

schedule 2. (1) The Acts mentioned in the Schedule to the extent to 
which they are in that Schedule expressed to be amended or repealed 
shall be amended or repealed accordingly. 

(2) This Act shall be deemed to have come into operation with 
respect to the amendments made by the following items in the 
Schedule on the following dates: 

(a) Item 14 on 5 May 1981; 
(b) Item 28 on 1 July 1982; 
(c) Item 33 on 30 March 1982; 
(d) Items 57, 64 and 65 on 1 September 1981; 
(e) Item 69 on 1 March 1979; 
( / ) Item 72 on 1 July 1981; 
(g) Item 75 on 24 March 1982; 

(h) Item 



983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

(h) Item 99 on 24 March 1982; 
( i ) Item 114 on 13 July 1982; 
{/) Item 116 on 11 February 1982; 
(k) Item 118 on 24 November 1981; 
( /) Item 130 on 1 November 1981; 
{m) Item 143 on 23 December 1980; 
(M) Item 144 on 15 December 1981; 
(o) Item 153 on 2 August 1982; 
(p) Item 157 on 5 January 1982; 
(q) Item 160 on 16 December 1981; 
(r) Items 167, 168, 169, 170 and 171 on 18 December 1981; 
(s) Items 183 and 184 on 16 December 1981; 
(0 Item 187 on 19 May 1981; 
(u) Item 188 on 3 June 1981; 
(v) Items 189, 191, 193, 194 and 195 on 1 September 1981; 
(w) Item 196 on 5 January 1982; 
{x) Item 203 on 24 March 1981; 
(y) Item 208 on 28 April 1982; 
(z) Item 213 on 13 January 1982; 
{aa) Item 216 on 2 August 1982; 
(ab) Items 217 and 218 on 3 March 1982; 
(ac) Items 225, 226, 227, 228 and 230 on 19 May 1982; 
{ad)ltem 253 on 2 February 1981; 
{ae) Item 275 on 1 June 1981; and 
{af) Item 277 on the day of commencement of the Wildlife 

{Protection of Whales) Act 1981. 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE 

Item Act 
No. No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

1 7772 Alcoholics and Drug-
dependent Persons Act 
1968 

9008 Bail Act 1977 

9720 Building Control Act 1981 

>* t» 

8693 Building Industry Long 
Service Leave Act 1975 

9 6217 Cemeteries Act 1958 

10 9227 Charities Act 1978 

11 »> »» t t 

In section 5 (2)— 
(a) for the words "Chief Secretary" 

there shall be substituted the 
words "Minister for Community 
Welfare Services"; and 

(6) for the expression "Director-
General of Social Welfare" there 
shall be substituted the words 
"Director-General of Community 
Welfare Services". 

In section 18A (1) for the words "in 
behalf of" there shall be substituted the 
words "on behalf of". 

In section 56 (1) (a) for the words "in a 
hearing" there shall be substituted the 
words "in hearing". 

In section 62 (2) after paragraph (a) the 
word "and" is repealed. 

In section 85 in the interpretation of 
"Register" for the words "Register of 
Plumbers Gasfitters and Drainers" there 
shall be substituted the words 
"Plumbers Gasfitters and Drainers 
Register". 

In section 147 (1) for the words "any 
buildings works" there shall be 
substituted the words "any building 
works". 

In the Schedule in item 90 for the 
expression "9A" there shall be sub
stituted the expression "9A (1)". 

In section 15B (1)— 
(a) after the words "construction work 

in Victoria" there shall be inserted 
the words "or who is domiciled 
in Victoria and employs workers 
in building and construction work 
in Victoria and in a State or 
States other than Victoria"; and 

(6) in paragraph (a) the words "or 
who is domiciled in Victoria 
and employs workers in building 
and construction work in Victoria 
and in a State or States other than 
Victoria" are repealed. 

In sections 37 (1) and 89 (3) for the words 
"Consolidated Revenue" there shall be 
substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

In section 17 (1) for the words "Minister 
for Health" there shall be substituted 
the words "Minister of Health". 
In section 17 (2)— 
(a) for the words "the inspector may 

summons" there shall be substitu
ted the words "the inspector may 
summon"; and 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

9227 Charities Act 
1978—continued 

8477 Children's Court Act 1973 

9532 Chiropractors and 
Osteopaths {Registration) 
Act 1980 

6221 Coal Mines Act 1958 

8089 Community Welfare 
Services Act 1970 

f i »» 

f t »» 

t> »» 

i t t t 

t t t t 

» t t t 

(b) for the expression "summonsing" 
there shall be substituted the word 
"summoning". 

In section 17 (2) for the words "with the 
the adaptations" there shall be 
substituted the words "with the 
adaptations". 

In section 22 (4) (c) for the words "the 
child be placed" there shall be substitut
ed the words "the child may be placed". 

In section 1 (1) for the expression "1980" 
there shall be substituted the expression 
"1981". 

In section 103 (5) (a) (ii) for the expression 
"the section 5 (1)" there shall be 
substituted the expression "section 
5 (1)". 

In section 35 (2) (c) for the words "in 
unreasonably" there shall be substituted 
the words "is unreasonably". 

In sections 38 (2), 42 and 43 for the words 
"State Savings Bank" there shall be 
substituted the words "State Bank". 

In section 81 (3) for the words "he 
brought" there shall be substituted 
the words "be brought". 

In section 106 (2) for the words "State 
Savings Bank" there shall be substituted 
the words "State Bank". 

In section 135 (1) for the words "be 
bought" there shall be substituted the 
words "be brought". . 

In section 153 in the interpretation of 
"Prison" for the expression "Part IV" 
there shall be substituted the expression 
"Part V". 

In section 168 (1) for the words "all 
purposes a sentence" there shall be 
substituted the words "all purposes be 
a sentence". 

In section 171 (IB) for the expression 
"sub-section (2A)" there shall be 
substituted the expression "paragraph 
(a) of sub-section (3)". 

In section 178 (2) (b) for the expression 
"Director-General of Social Welfare" 
there shall be substituted the expression 
"Director-General". 

In section 198 for the expression "(1) 
The Adult Parole" there shall be 
substituted the expression "The Adult 
Parole''. 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item Act 
No. No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

26 8089 Community Welfare 
Services Act 1970— 
continued 

27 

28 9699 Companies (Consequential 
Amendments) Act 1981 

29 8750 Constitution Act 1975 

30 9718 Co-operation Act 1981 

31 

32 

In paragraphs (a) and (b) of section 203 
for the expression "Part II" there shall 
be substituted the expression "Part 
III". 

In Schedule Three and Schedule Three A 
for the expression "Social Welfare Act 
1970" there shall be substituted the 
expression "Community Welfare 
Services Act 1970". 

In Schedule 2— 
(a) in the item relating to section 77 

of the Building Societies Act 1976 
for the words "there were 
substituted" there shall be sub
stituted the words "there shall be 
substituted"; 

(b) in the item relating to the Latrobe 
Valley Act 1958— 
(i) for the expression "paragraph 

( / ) " there shall be substituted 
the, expression "paragraph 
(d)"; and 

(ii) in the proposed new paragraph 
for the expression " ( / ) on 
deposit" there shall be sub
stituted the expression "(d) 
on deposit"; 

(c) in the item relating to section 
137N of the Stamps Act 1958 for 
the expression "(b) in paragraph 
(b)" there shall be substituted the 
expression "(b) in paragraph (c)"; 
and 

(d) in the item relating to section 
41 of the Strata Titles Act 1967 
after the expression "section 41" 
there shall be inserted the 
expression "(1)". 

In section 83 (2c) (b) after sub-paragraph 
(i) for the word "or" there shall be 
substituted the word "and". 

In section 3 in the table for the expression 
"Part XII.—Administration ss. 207-
220" there shall be substituted the 
expression "Part XII.—Administration 
ss. 207-218". 

In section 19 (8)— 
(a) after paragraph (d) the word 

"and" shall be repealed; and 
(b) after paragraph ( / ) there shall be 

inserted the word "and". 

In section 53 (5) for the word "register" 
there shall be substituted the word 
"Registrar". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 333 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

33 

34 

35 

36 

37 

38 

39 

40 

41 

9718 Co-operation Act 1981— 
continued 

9595 

6228 

Council of Adult Education 
Act 1981 

Country Fire Authority 
Act 1958 

42 

43 

In Schedule One for the expression 
"9295" there shall be substituted the 
expression "9275". 

In Part II. of Schedule Two in paragraphs 
20 (2), 21 and 22 (1) for the word 
"Commissioner" there shall be sub
stituted the word "Registrar". 

In section 6 the expression "(1)" shall be 
repealed. 

In section 9A (1) for the expression "Public 
Service Act 1958" there shall be 
substituted the expression "Public 
Service Act 1974". 

In section 35 for the words "Commission 
of Public Health" there shall be 
substituted the words "Health Commis
sion". 

In section 45 (2) for the words "court of 
petty sessions" there shall be 
substituted the words "magistrates' 
court". 

In sections 51 (c) and 54 (1) (e) for the 
expression "of any Crown land reserved 
from sale for the purposes of a national 
park pursuant to the Land Act 1958" 
there shall be substituted the words 
"any part of a national park". 

In section 67 for the words "Consolidated 
Revenue" (where twice occurring) 
there shall be substituted the words 
"Consolidated Fund". 

In section 72— 
(a) for the words "said Act" (where 

first occurring) there shall be 
substituted the expression 
" Workers Compensation Act 1958"; 
and 

(b) for the words "the said Act" 
(where second occurring) there 
shall be substituted the words 
"that Act". 

In section 77 (b) for the word "licensed" 
there shall be substituted the words 
"registered or deemed to be registered". 

In section 82 (4)— 
(a) for the words "State Savings 

Bank of Victoria" there shall be 
substituted the words "State Bank 
of Victoria"; and 

(b) for the expression "State Savings 
Bank Act 1958" there shall be 
substituted the expression "State 
Bank Act 1958". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

44 

45 

46 

47 

48 

49 

50 

51 

52 

53 

54 

55 

56 

57 

6228 Country Fire Authority 
Act 1958—continued 

9668 Credit Act 1981 

»» »» 

6231 Crimes Act 1958 

9576 Crimes (Classification of 
Offences) Act 1981 

In section 87 (10) (o) for the word 
"licensed" there shall be substituted 
the words "registered or deemed to be 
registered". 

In section 26 (1) (c) (i) for the word 
"recission" there shall be substituted 
the word "rescission". 

In section 51 (1) for the word "lone" 
there shall be substituted the word 
"loan". 

In section 60 (4) for the word "contact" 
there shall be substituted the word 
"contract". 

In section 150 (4) (ft) for the words 
"written on printed" there shall be 
substituted the words "written or 
printed". 

In section 198 (1) for the expression 
"pursuants" there shall be substituted 
the word "pursuant". 

In section 206 the expression "(1)" shall 
be repealed. 

In Schedule 5 clause 1 (b) (ii) for the 
words "is is" there shall be substituted 
the word "is". 

After section 357 the heading "(3) Bail 
for Limited Time or until Happening of 
Specified Event." is repealed. 

"(7) After section 361 the heading 
Revocation of Bail." is repealed. 

In section 436 for the words "indictment 
presentment or information" there shall 
be substituted the words "indictment 
or presentment". 

In section 506 in the interpretation of 
"Director-General"— 
(a) for the expression "Director-

General of Social Welfare" there 
shall be substituted the expression 
"Director-General of Community 
Welfare Services"; and 
for the expression "Social Welfare 
Act 1960" there shall be substituted 
the expression "Community Wel
fare Services Act 1970". 

In section 543 (1) for the words "or or" 
there shall be substituted the word "or". 

In the Schedule in the item relating to 
Act No. 5020 for the expression "Farm 
Water Supply Advances Act 1944" there 
shall be substituted the expression 
"Farm Water Supplies Advances Act 
1944". 

SCHEDULE 

(b) 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item Act 
No. No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

58 9576 Crimes {Classification of 
Offences) Act 1981— 
continued 

60 

61 

62 

63 

64 

65 

66 8359 Criminal Injuries 

Compensation Act 1972 

67 

68 „ ,, ,, 

69 9212 Crown Land {Reserves) 

Act 1978 

70 4989 Discharged Servicemen's 
Preference Act 1943 

In the Schedule in the first item relating 
to Act No. 6231— 
{a) the expression commencing "44 

(1), 46," and finishing "61, 62," 
shall be repealed; and 

(6) the expression "68 (1) and (2)," 
shall be repealed. 

In the Schedule in the third item relating 
to Act No. 6231 the expression "68 
(3B)," shall be repealed. 

In the Schedule in the fourth item relating 
to Act No. 6231— 
{a) the expression commencing "48 

(2), 54 (1)," and finishing "59, 
60 (1)," shall be repealed; and 

(ft) the expression "68 (3) and (3A), 
69 (1), (2) and (4)," shall be 
repealed. 

In the Schedule in the fifth item relating 
to Act No. 6231 for the expression 
"sections 55 (3), 68 (3B) and" there 
shall be substituted the word "section". 

In the Schedule in the sixth item relating 
to Act No. 6231 the expression ", 426, 
436" shall be repealed. 

In the Schedule the twenty-seventh item 
relating to Act No. 6231 shall be 
repealed. 

In the Schedule in the first item relating 
to Act No. 6251 for the expression 
' "a felony or indictable offence"' 
there shall be substituted the expression 
' "a felony or an indictable offence" '. 

In the Schedule in the item relating to 
Act No. 8731 after the expression "and 
misdemeanours," ' there shall be inser
ted the expression "shall be repealed". 

In section 4 (5), (6) (6) and (8) for the 
expression "Public Service Act 1958" 
there shall be substituted the expression 
"Public Service Act 1974". 

In section 9 (6) for the words "an infant" 
there shall be substituted the words "a 
minor". 

In section 19 (1) for the words "Chief 
Secretary" there shall be substituted 
the word "Minister". 

In the Second Schedule in the item 
relating to the Geelong Regional 
Commission Act 1977 for the expression 
"18 {b)" there shall be substituted the 
expression "18 (1) (6)". 

In section 8 {b) (ii) for the expression 
"Adoption of Children Act 1928" there 
shall be substituted the expression 
"Adoption of Children Act 1964". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

71 

72 

73 

74 

6237 Drainage Areas Act 1958 

9567 Economic Development 
Act 1981 

6240 Education Act 1958 

75 9582 Education (Amendment) Act 
1981 

76 9714 Education Service Act 1981 

77 »» »» »» 

78 6244 Essential Services Act 1958 

79 

80 

81 

82 

83 

84 

In section 23 (2) for the words "Railway 
Construction Board" there shall be 
substituted the words "Railway Con
struction and Property Board". 

In the Schedule in the item relating to 
Act No. 6289 for the expression "5 (5)" 
there shall be substituted the expression 
"4 (7)". 

In section 1 in the table of Parts and 
Divisions the expression "Part V.— 
Adult Education ss. 65-78." shall be 
repealed. 

In section 48 (3) for the words "Con
solidated Revenue" there shall be 
substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

In section 9 (2) for the expression "48 
(2)" there shall be substituted the 
expression "48 (3)". 

In section 32 (2) for the word "Board" 
there shall be substituted the word 
"Commission". 

In section 74 (5) for the word "had" there 
shall be substituted the word "has". 

In section 3 in the interpretation of 
"Essential service" for the expression 
"Gas Regulation Act 1958" there shall 
be substituted the expression "Gas Act 
1969". 

In section 16 for the words "Consolidated 
Revenue" there shall be substituted 
the words "Consolidated Fund". 

In section 58 in the interpretation of 
"Bank" and in section 71 in the 
interpretation of "Bank" for the words 
"State Savings Bank" there shall be 
substituted the words "State Bank". 

In section 67 (2) for the expression "sub
section" there shall be substituted the 
word "section". 

In section 70 (9) for the words "so far 
only" there shall be substituted the 
words "in so far only". 

In section 75A (3) for the expression 
"section 408 and section 408A of the 
Crimes Act 1958" there shall be 
substituted the expression "sections 
80D and 80F of the Motor Car Act 
1958". 

7274 Farm Produce Merchants In section 4 for the expression "Public 
and Commission Agents Service Act 1958" there shall be 
Act 1965 substituted the expression "Public 

Service Act 1974". 

9428 Estate Agents Act 1980 

6246 Evidence Act 1958 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

85 

86 

87 

88 

89 

90 

91 

92 

93 

94 

95 

96 

7274 

6251 Firearms Act 1958 

Farm Produce Merchants 
and Commission Agents 
Act 1965—continued 

7780 Fisheries Act 1968 

97 

98 

9550 

In section 13 (1) for the words "court of 
petty sessions" there shall be substituted 
the words "magistrates' court". 

In section 26 (1) (6) for the expression 
"Gaols Act 1958" there shall be 
substituted the expression "Community 
Welfare Services Act 1970". 

In sections 29B (2) and 29c (2) (c) for 
the words "Chief Secretary" there shall 
be substituted the word "Minister". 

In section 36A (2) (b) for the expression 
"Social Welfare Act 1970" there shall 
be substituted the expression 
"Community Welfare Services Act 
1970". 

In section 1 (1) for the expression "9M" 
there shall be substituted the expression 
"9N". 

In section 5 (1) for the expression 
"Public Service Act 1958" there shall 
be substituted the expression "Public 
Service Act 1974". 

In sections 19 (4), 49 (6) and 70 for the 
words "Consolidated Revenue" there 
shall be substituted the words "Con
solidated Fund". 

In section 11 (4) (6) for the word "its" 
there shall be substituted the word 
"his". 

In section 9 (7) for the expression 
"regulutions" there shall be substituted 
the word "regulations". 

In section 15 (1) (A) for the words 
"Teacher Housing Authority" there 
shall be substituted the words "Govern
ment Employee Housing Authority". 

In section 4 for the expression "4. There" 
there shall be substituted the expression 
"4. (1) There". 

In section 14 (1) (ea) for the expression 
'(2) to (7) both inclusive under the 
heading "IX. Settlement or Gift, Deed 
o f " there shall be substituted the 
expression '(1) to (7) both inclusive 
under the heading "IX. Instrument of 
Settlement" \ 

Government Employee In section 3 (3) (d) for the words 
Housing Authority Act "Minister for Public Works" there 
1981 shall be substituted the words 

"Minister of Public Works". 
„ „ In section 12 (7) for the expression 

"sub-section (4)" there shall be 
substituted the expression "sub-section 
(6)". 

SCHEDULE 

9702 Fuel Prices Regulation Act 
1981 

9024 Geelong Regional 
Commission Act 1977 

Geelong Waterworks and 
Sewerage Act 1958 

6263 

8176 Gift Duty Act 1971 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHED ULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

99 

100 

101 

102 

103 

104 

105 

9550 Government Employee 
Housing Authority Act 
1981—continued 

7849 Groundwater Act 1969 

6270 Health Act 1958 

106 

107 

»» »» 

108 

In section 25 (2) for the words "third 
proviso" there shall be substituted the 
words "second proviso". 

In section 2 (1) in the interpretation of 
"Inspector" for the words "Minister 
of Mines" there shall be substituted 
the words "Minister for Minerals and 
Energy". 

In section 16 (2) (a) for the words "court 
of petty sessions" there shall be 
substituted the expression 
"magistrates' court". 

In section 24 (1) for the words 
"Commission of Public Health" there 
shall be substituted the words "Health 
Commission". 

In section 31 (6) for the words "Drill 
Superintendent" there shall be 
substituted the words "Chief Engineer 
(Drilling)". 

In sections 44 (1) and 45 (1) for the words 
"Commission of Public Health" there 
shall be substituted the words 
"Health Commission". 

In section 3— 
(a) in the interpretation of 

"Household insecticide" for the 
expression "Licensing Act 1958" 
there shall be substituted the 
expression "Liquor Control Act 
1968"; 

(6) in the interpretation of "Licensed 
victualler" for the expression 
"Licensing Act 1958" there shall 
be substituted the. expression 
"Liquor Control Act 1968"; and 

(c) in the interpretation of "Medical 
practitioner" for the expression 
"Medical Act 1958" there shall be 
substituted the expression 
"Medical Practitioners Act 1970". 

In section 66 (7) (b) for the expression 
"Labour and Industry Act 1958 or the 
Apprenticeship Act 1958" there shall 
be substituted the expression 
"Industrial Training Act 1975". 

In section 108A in the interpretation of 
"Pesticide" for the expression "pesticide 
within the meaning of the Pesticides 
Act 1958" there shall be substituted the 
expression "agricultural chemical within 
the meaning of the Agricultural 
Chemicals Act 1958". 

In section 144 (3) for the expression 
"sixty eight" there shall be substituted 
the expression "sixty-eight". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

109 

110 

111 

112 

113 

114 

115 

116 

6270 Health Act 1958—continued In section 208A (2) (d) for the expression 
"Social Welfare Act 1970" there shall 
be substituted the expression 
"Community Welfare Services Act 
1970". 

In sections 209A (5) and 211A (where 
thrice occurring) for the words 
"boarding house" there shall be 
substituted the expression 
"boarding-house". 

In section 263 (4) for the words "the 
Commission may in his discretion" 
there shall be substituted the words 
"the Commission may in its discretion". 

In section 289 (3) for the expression 
"Licensing Act 1958" there shall be 
substituted the expression "Liquor 
Control Act 1968". 

9667 Historic Buildings Act 1981 In section 41 (7) for the expression 
"convenant" (where twice occurring) 
there shall be substituted the word 
"covenant". 

9764 Hospital Benefits (Levy) 
Act 1982 

6274 Hospitals and Charities 
Act 1958 

9664 Hospitals Superannuation 
(General Amendment) 
Act 1981 

In section 1 (2) the words "be deemed to 
have" are repealed. 

In the section which commences "64A. 
In this Division" for the expression 
"64A." there shall be substituted the 
expression "64B.". 

In section 20 for the expression "section 
6 of the Hospitals Superannuation 
(Amendment) Act 1980" there shall be 
substituted the expression "section 
35ZFAA of the Hospitals Superannuation 
Act 1965". 

117 

118 

9553 

9603 

Housing (Amendment) Act 
1981 

Housing (Further 
Amendment) Act 1981 

In section 
paragraph 
repealed. 

13, 
(a) 

sub-section (1) and 
of sub-section (2) are 

119 9365 Industrial 
1979 

Relations Act 

In section 3— 
(a) for the word "paragraph" there 

shall be substituted the word 
"clause"; and 

(b) in paragraphs (a) (b) and (c) for 
the expression "sub-paragraph" 
there shall be substituted the 
expression "sub-clause". 

In section 25 for the expression "(3) 
Without" there shall be substituted 
the expression "(2A) Without". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item Act 
No. No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

120 9365 Industrial Relations Act 
1979—continued 

123 9717 Industrial Safety, Health 
and Welfare Act 1981 

125 7651 Juries Act 1967 

126 6283 Labour and Industry Act 
1958 

In section 57 for the words "context 
or or" there shall be substituted the 
words "context or". 

In section 69 (a) for the expression "in 
lieu thereo" there shall be substituted 
the words "in lieu thereof". 

In section 87 for the expression "(3) 
When an inspector" there shall be 
substituted the expression "(3A) When 
an inspector". 

In section 22 (2) for the expression 
"worplace" there shall be substituted 
the word "workplace". 

In section 33 (1) (z) for the expression 
"$1000 or any breach" there shall be 
substituted the expression "$1000 for 
any breach". 

In section 20A (1) for the expression "as 
is possible)" there shall be substituted 
the expression "as is possible". 

In section 1 in the table of Parts and 
Divisions— 

(a) that portion of the table relating 
to Part III. is repealed; 

(6) that portion of the table relating 
to Part V. is repealed; 

(c) in that portion of the table relating 
to Part VII.— 
(i) for the expression "Part VII.— 

Various Trades ss. 99-121." 
there shall be substituted the 
expression "Part VII.— 
Various Trades ss. 104-106c"; 
and 

(ii) those portions relating to 
Divisions 1, 4, 5 and 6 are 
repealed; and 

(rf) in that portion of the table relating 
to Part VIII.— 

(i) fortheexpression"PartVIII.— 
Places and Conditions of 
Employment ss. 122-173." 
there shall be substituted the 
expression "Part VIII.— 
Places and Conditions of 
Employment ss. 122-139."; 
and 

(ii) those portions relating to 
Divisions 3 and 4 are 
repealed. 

In section 53 (3) for the words "the the" 
there shall be substituted the word 
"the". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

128 

129 

6283 Labour and Industry Act 
1958—continued 

After section 55 the headings— 
"PART V.—FACTORIES 

130 

131 

9583 Labour and Industry 
(Further Amendment) 
Acrmi 

6284 Land Act 1958 

132 

133 

134 

135 

136 

8008 Land Conservation Act 1970 

6289 Land Tax Act 1958 

6290 Latrobe Valley Act 1958 

7629 Lifts and Cranes Act 1967 

137 7695 Liquor Control Act 1968 

138 

DIVISION 1 . -
FACTORIES."— 

are repealed. 

-CONDITIONS 

After section 106c. the headings— 
"DIVISION 3.—MEAT. 

DIVISION 4.—MILK. 

DIVISION 5.—WATCHMEN. 

DIVISION 6.—BILLPOSTING."— 

are repealed. 

In section 4 (c) (i) after the expression 
' "sub-section (2B)" ' there shall be 
inserted the expression "(where first 
occurring)". 

In section 93 (2) (a)— 
(a) for the words "State Savings Bank" 

there shall be substituted the 
words "State Bank"; and 

(b) for the expression "State Savings 
Bank Act 1958" there shall be 
substituted the expression "State 
Bank Act 1958". 

In section 3 (1) (g) for the words "the 
Secretary for Mines or his nominee" 
there shall be substituted the words 
"the Secretary for Minerals and 
Energy or his nominee". 

In sections 3 (17) (d) and 4 (1), (3) and 
(4) for the expression "Public Service 
Act 1958" there shall be substituted 
the expression "Public Service Act 
1974" 

In section 9 (lc) (b) the words "of the 
Principal Act" are repealed. 

In section 50A (c) for the words "State 
Savings Bank" there shall be substituted 
the words "State Bank". 

In section 23 (3) for the words 
"Consolidated Revenue" there shall 
be substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

In section 25 (1)— 
(a) after paragraph (kb) the word 

"or" is repealed; and 
(b) after paragraph (kg) there shall 

be inserted the word "or". 

In section 26 (13) for the words "means 
any hours" there shall be substituted 
the words "mean any hours". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

139 

140 

141 

142 

143 

144 

7695 Liquor Control Act 1968— In section 28 (1) (e) after sub-paragraph 
continued (i) the word "or" is repealed. 

„ „ „ In section 38c (lj.(6) for the words "as 
is specified" there shall be substituted 
the words, "as are specified". 

,, „ „ In section 52 (1) for the words "canteen 
licence" there shall be substituted the 
words "a canteen licence". 

„ „ „ In section 156 (5) (b) for the words 
"wholesale liquor or merchant's 
licence" there shall be substituted the 
words "wholesale liquor merchant's 
licence". 

9496 Liquor Control (Amendment) In section 36 for the expression "(where 
Act 1980 fifth occurring)" there shall be 

substituted the expression "(where 
fourth occurring)". 

9639 Listing of Debtors Act 
1981 

In section 2— 
(a) for the expression 'offence. 

(*) 

'there 
shall be substituted the expression 
'offence.'; and :. 
for the expression '5 penalty 
units.' there shall be substituted 
the expression '5 penalty units.".'. 

145 

146 

147 

148 

149 

150 

151 

152 

7145 Litter Act 1964 

6297 Livery and Agistment Act 
1958 

6298 Local Authorities 
Superannuation Act 1958 

In section 3B (14) for the expression 
"sub-section" there shall be substituted 
the word "section". 

In section 4 (2) (c) for the words 
"Consolidated Revenue" there shall be 
substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

In section 4 (1) after the words "to be by 
him for fee" there shall be inserted the 
word "or". . 

In section 7 for the expression "such 
liveryrstable or agister" there shall be 
substituted the expression "such 
livery-stable keeper or agister". 

In section 8 (3) (a) forthe expression "(if 
the address of person" there shall be 
substituted the expression "(if the 
address of the person". 

In section 3 (4) after the expression 
"Division 1 or Division 2" there shall 
be inserted the expression "of Part I.". 

In sections 11 HGA (2) (a), 11 JGA and 11 JGAB 
the words "of this Act" are repealed. 

In section 1 IJGA for the words "employe 
who is absent" there shall be 
substituted the words "employe' • is 
absent". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

153 

154 

155 

156 

157 

158 

159 

160 

161 

162 

163 

164 

165 

9751 Local Authorities 
Superannuation 
(Amendment) Act 1982 

6299 Local Government Act 1958 

9715 Lotteries Gaming and 
Betting (Amendment) 
Act 1981 

8184 Magistrates'Courts Act 
1971 

6302 Marine Act 1958 

9616 

8061 

Marine (Amendment) Act 
1981 

Medical Practitioners Act 
1970 

6310 Melbourne and Metropolitan 
Board of Works Act 1958 

In section 14 after the expression "After 
Division 6" there shall be inserted the 
expression "of Part I". 

In section 109 (2) for the words "a 
misdemeanour" there shall be 
substituted the words "an indictable 
offence". 

In section 446 (3) after the words 
"separate rate" there shall be inserted 
the word "or". 

In section 808 (1) for the words "Minister 
of Public Health" there shall be 
substituted the words "Minister of 
Health". 

In section 1 (3) and (4) the expression 
"paragraphs (b) and (c) of" is repealed. 

In section 28 (3) for the words 
"Commission of Public Health" there 
shall be substituted the words "Health 
Commission". 

In section 244 for the words "fraudulently 
alters assist in" there shall be 
substituted the words "fraudulently 
alters assists in". 

In section 24 for the expression ' "The 
engine-surveyors' there shall be 
substituted the expression ' "The 
engineer-surveyors'. 

In section 17 (13) for the expression 
"Poisons, Drugs and Controlled 
Substances Act 1981" there shall be 
substituted the expression "Drugs, 
Poisons and Controlled Substances Act 
1981". 

In section 19 (6) (c) for the word 
"specified" there shall be substituted 
the word "specifies". 

In section 239 for the words "Railway 
Construction Board", there shall be 
substituted the words "Railway 
Construction and Property Board". 

In section 239o (1) for the expression 
"sub-section (3)" there shall be 
substituted the expression "sub-section 
(4)". 

In the Tenth Schedule in paragraph (3) 
for the expression "eight per cent per 
annum" there shall be substituted the 
expression "a rate to be determined.by 
the Board in accordance with the 
provisions of the Melbourne and 
Metropolitan Board of Works Act 
1958". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item Act 
No. No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

166 8546 Melbourne Cricket Club Act 
1974 

167 9619 Melbourne University 
(Amendment) Act 1981 

168 ,, ,, ,, 

169 

170 

171 

172 8023 Melbourne Underground 
Rail Loop Act 1970 

173 

174 

175 

176 

177 

178 6320 Mines Act 1958 

179 8429 Motor Accidents Act 1973 

180 6325 Motor Car Act 1958 

In section 4 (3), (4) and (5) for the 
expression "sub-section (1)" there shall 
be substituted the expression 
"subjection (2)". 

In section 8 (2) after the expression 
"section 6" there shall be inserted the 
words "of the Principal Act". 

In section 8 (3) after the expression 
"section 15 (3)" there shall be inserted 
the words "of the Principal Act". 

In section 17 after the expression "For 
section 33" there shall be inserted the 
words "of the Principal Act". 

In section 20 after the expression "section 
41 (3) (c)" there shall be inserted the 
words "of the Principal Act". 

In section 21 after the expression "For 
section 44" there shall be inserted the 
words "of the Principal Act". 

In section 5 (3) for the expression "Public 
Service Act 1958" there shall be 
substituted the expression "Public 
Service Act 1974". 

In section 9 (2) for the expression 
"occured" there shall be substituted 
the word "occurred". 

In section 11 (2) the word "or" (where 
first occurring) is repealed. 

In section 26 (1) for the word 
"Commissioners" there shall be 
substituted the words "Victorian 
Railways Board". 

In section 40 (2) for the words "and or 
such conditions" there shall be 
substituted the words "and on such 
conditions". 

In Schedule Two— 
(a) after clause 5 (2) (a) the word 

"and" shall be repealed; 
(b) after clause 5 (2) (c) there shall 

be inserted the word "and". 

In section 87 for the words "Consolidated 
Revenue" there shall be substituted 
the words "Consolidated Fund". 

In section 15 (1) for the expression 
"Volunteer Civil Defence Workers 
Compensation Act 1972" (where twice 
occurring) there shall be substituted 
the expression "Victoria State 
Emergency Service Act 1981". 

In section 7A (2) for the words "Chief 
Commissioner" there shall be 
substituted the word "Board". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act 

181 6325 Motor Car Act 1958— 
continued 

182 » „ 

183 9548 Motor Car (Mass and 
Dimensions Limits) Act 
1981 

Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

184 

185 6832 Motor Boating Act 1961 

186 8702 National Parks Act 1975 

187 

188 

189 

9570 National Parks 
(Amendment) Act 1981 

9554 Penalties and Sentences Act 
1981 

In section 21B (2E) for the words 
"Consolidated Revenue" there shall 
be substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

In section 80F (11) (a) for the words 
"member or" there shall be substituted 
the words "member of". 

In section 2 (1) (m)— 
(a) in sub-paragraph (i) for the 

expression "(where thrice 
occurring)" there shall be 
substituted the expression "(where 
four times occurring)"; 

(b) sub-paragraph (ii) is repealed. 
In section 35 (a)— 

(a) in sub-paragraph (iii) for the 
expression 'sub-paragraphs (viia) 
and (viii) after the words "motor 
cars" (where respectively 
occurring)' there shall be 
substituted the expression 'sub
paragraph (viia) after the words 
"motor cars"'. 

(b) after sub-paragraph (iii) there shall 
be inserted the following 
sub-paragraph: 
'(iv) in sub-paragraph (viii) after 

the words "motor car" there 
shall be inserted the words 
"trailer or semi-trailer";'. 

In section 14 for the words "by the 
Victorian branch of the Repatriation 
Commission of the Commonwealth of 
Australia" there shall be substituted 
the expression "pursuant to the 
Repatriation Act 1920 of the 
Commonwealth (as amended from 
time to time)". 

In section 33 (3)— 
(a) in paragraph (e) for the words 

"Minister for Transport" there 
shall be substituted the words 
"Minister of Transport"; and 

(b) in paragraph ( / ) for the words 
"or or" there shall be substituted 
the word "or". 

In section 10 (b) for the expression 
"following sub-sections:" there shall 
be substituted the expression 
"following sub-section:". 

In section 45 (c) for the expression 
"paragraph (a) of sub-section (1)" 
there shall be substituted the expression 
"paragraph (a) in sub-section (1)". 

In Schedule One in item 16 for the 
expression "8276" there shall be 
substituted the expression "7405". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeat 

190 

191 

192 
193 

194 

9554 Penalties and Sentences Act 
1981—continued 

195 

196 

197 

198 

199 

200 

201 

202 

9684 Pensioners Rates Remission 
Act 1981 

7417 Pensions Supplementation 
Act 1966 

9772 Petroleum (Submerged 
Lands) Act 1982 

7722 Police Assistance 
Compensation Act 1968 

In Schedule Two items 130, 131 and 185 
shall be repealed. . 

In Schedule Two for the expression 
"Patriotic Funds 1958" (wherever 
occurring) there shall be substituted 
the expression "Patriotic Funds Act 
1958". 

In Schedule Two item 275 is repealed. 
In Schedule Two in item 306 after the 

expression ' "$500"' there shall be 
inserted the expression "(where second 
occurring)". 

In Schedule Two in item 313— 
(a) for the expression ' "$100" * there 

shall be substituted the expression 
'"$1000"'; and 

(b) after the expression ' "penalty 
units" ' there shall be inserted the 
expression ', for the expression 
"$1500" there shall be substituted 
the expression "15 penalty units" 
and for the expression "$2500" 
there shall be substituted the 
expression 25 penalty units"'. 

In Schedule Two in item 344 for the 
expression ' "$200, (where twice 
appearing)" * there shall be substituted 
the expression ' "$200" (where twice 
appearing)'. 

In section 3 (1) for the expression 
"section 159A (5)" there shall be 
substituted the expression "section 
159A (1)". 

Section 5 (4) (c) is repealed. 

In section 4 (5) (6) for the words 
"Consolidated Revenue" there shall be 
substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

In section 101 (2)— 
(a) after paragraph (b) the word "or" 

is repealed; and 
(b) after paragraph (c) there shall be 

inserted the word "or". 

In sections 2 (3) (where twice occurring) 
and (4) and 4 for the words "Chief 
Secretary" there shall be substituted 
the word "Minister". 

In section 5 for the words "Consolidated 
Revenue" there shall be substituted the 
words "Consolidated Fund". 

In section 6 for the words "Chief 
Secretary" there shall be substituted 
the word "Minister". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE-

Item Act 
No. No. Title of Act 

203 9521 Police Offences (Restricted 
Publications) Act 1981 

204 6338 Police Regulation Act 1958 

205 

206 ,, ,, ,, 

207 

208 9646 Police Regulation 
(Amendment) Act 1981 

209 9555 Port Bellarine Tourist 
Resort Act 1981 

210 6312 Port of Melbourne Authority 
Act 1958 

211 

212 

213 9635 Port of Portland Authority 
Act 1981 

214 6350 Public Trustee Act 1958 

215 6353 Racing Act 195S 

216 9671 Racing (Amendment) Act 
1981 

217 ,, ii »• 

•continued 

Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

In section 2 ( / ) for the expression 
"180JA (b)" there shall be substituted 
the expression "180M (1) (b)". 

In section 13 (2) for the words "Chief 
Secretary" there shall be substituted 
the word "Minister". 

In sections 32, 33, 34 and 55 (5A) for 
the words "Consolidated Revenue" 
there shall be substituted the words 
"Consolidated Fund". 

In section 67 (b) for the words "Chief 
Secretary" there shall be substituted 
the word "Minister". 

In sections 72 (1) and 122 (3) for the 
words "Consolidated Revenue" there 
shall be substituted the words 
"Consolidated Fund". 

In section 7 after the expression "77" 
there shall be inserted the words "of 
the Principal Act". 

In section 10 (1) after paragraph (d) the 
word "and" is repealed. 

In section 25 for the word "them" there 
shall be substituted the words "the 
Authority". 

In section 30— 
(a) for the words "Authority or of 

any of them" there shall be 
substituted the words "Authority 
or. of any of its members"; and 

(b) for the words "member or that 
they" there shall be substituted 
the words "member or that the 
members". 

In section 134B (1) (a) for the words 
"State Savings Bank" there shall be 
substituted the words "State Bank". 

In item 5 in the Schedule for the 
expression "experssion" there shall be 
substituted the word "expression". 

In section 56A (1) for the words "either 
or both" there shall be substituted the 
words "any. one or more". 

In section 19 for the expression "19 
Notwithstanding" there shall be 
substituted the expression "19. (1) 
Notwithstanding". . 

In section 19 (b) for the expression "the 
following sub-section" there shall be 
substituted the expression "the 
following sub-sections". 

In section,29 after the expression "46" 
there shall be inserted the expression 
"(l)and(3)". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item Act 
No. No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

218 

219 

220 

221 

222 

223 

224 

225 

226 

227 

228 

229 

230 

231 

232 

9671 

8407 

6564 

9562 

8486 

6377 

9549 

Racing (Amendment) Act 
1981—continued 

Recreation Vehicles Act 
1973 

Registration of Births 
Deaths and Marriages 
Act 1959 

Securities Industry 
(Application of Laws) 
Act 1981 

Small Claims Tribunals Act 
1973 

State Electricity 
Commission Act 1958 

Statute Law Revision Act 
1981 

»» f t 

7405 Summary Offences Act 1966 

In section 32 for the expression "(where 
second occurring)" there shall be 
substituted the expression "(where 
third occurring)". 

In section 11 (1) for the word "he" there 
shall be substituted the word "it". 

In sections 41 (1) and 44 (where twice 
occurring) for the words "Chief 
Secretary" there shall be substituted 
the word "Minister". 

In Schedule 1 for the expression "13A. 
In section 51" there shall be substituted 
the expression "13B. In section 51". 

In section 13 for the expression "Public 
Service Act 1958" there shall be 
substituted the expression "Public 
Service Act 1974". 

In section 82A (1) and (2) for the words 
"Consolidated Revenue" there shall be 
substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

In section 92 (4) for the words "State 
Savings Bank" there shall be 
substituted the words "State Bank". 

In the Schedule in item 32 after the 
expression ' "Director-General of 
Social Welfare" ' there shall be inserted 
the expression "(where second 
occurring)". 

In the Schedule in item 166 for the 
expression "(where twice occurring)" 
there shall be substituted the expression 
"(where first occurring)". 

In the Schedule item 167 is repealed. 

In the Schedule in item 172 after the 
expression ' "business as" ' there shall 
be inserted the expression "(where 
first occurring)". 

In the Schedule item 223 is repealed. 

In the Schedule in item 254 after the 
expression "Wildlife (Amendment) Act" 
there shall be inserted the expression 
"1980". 

In section 3 in the interpretation of 
"public place" for the expression 
"Licensing Act 1958" there shall be 
substituted the expression "Liquor 
Control Act 1968". 

In section 6 (3) and in the proviso to 
section 30 (9) for the words 

"Consolidated Revenue" there shall be 
substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item Act 
No. No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

233 7405 Summary Offences Act 
1966—continued 

234 

235 

236 

237 7634 Sunday Entertainment 
Act 1967 

238 ,, ,, t» 

239 

240 6386 Superannuation Act 1958 

241 

242 6387 Supreme Court Act 1958 

243 

244 „ „ „ 

245 8548 Swan Hill Pioneer 
Settlement Act 1974 

246 „ „ .. 

In section 30 (10) for the words 
"Commission of Public Health" there 
shall be substituted the words "Health 
Commission". 

In sections 33 (4) and 34 (2) for the words 
"Consolidated Revenue" there shall 
be substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

After section 34 the heading "False 
Advertisements." is repealed. 

In sections 61 and 62 (where three times 
occurring) for the words "Consolidated 
Revenue" there shall be substituted 
the words "Consolidated Fund". 

In section 3 in the interpretation of 
"public entertainment" and in sections 
5 (1), 7, 8 (1), (2) and (3), 9 (1), (2) 
(where twice occurring), (3) (where 
three times occurring) and (5) and 12 
for the words "Chief Secretary" there 
shall be substituted the word 
"Minister". 

In section 12A for the words "Under 
Secretary" there shall be substituted 
the words "Secretary for Labour and 
Industry". 

In sections 13 (a) and 16 for the words 
"Chief Secretary" there shall be 
substituted the word "Minister". 

In section 29 (2A) (a) for the expression 
"calculted" there shall be substituted 
the word "calculated". 

In section 32AA (6) for the word 
"Country" there shall be substituted 
the word "County". 

In section 88 for the words "an infant" 
there shall be substituted the words "a 
minor". 

In section 189 (20) for the words 
"Consolidated Revenue" there shall be 
substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

In section 194 (3) for the expression 
"Social Welfare Act 1970" there shall 
be substituted the expression 
"Community Welfare Services Act 
1970". 

In section 8A for the expression "(2) 
Any lease" there shall be substituted 
the expression "(3) Any lease". 

In section 94 (3) after the word "offence" 
there shall be inserted the word "and". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item Act 
No. No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

247 6390 Tattersall Consultations 
Act 1958 

248 6391 Teaching Service Act 1958 

249 

250 

251 6849 Town and Country Planning 
Act 1961 

252 

253 9425 Town and Country Planning 
(Amalgamation) Act 1980 

254 6400 Transport Regulation Act 
1958 

255 6401 Trustee Act 1958 

256 6402 Trustee Companies Act 
1958 

257 »» >» »» 

258 

259 

260 

6406 Unlawful Assemblies and 
Processions Act 1958 

8968 Upper Yarra Valley and 
Dandenong Ranges 
Authority Act 1976 

In section 11 (1) (a) for the words 
"Consolidated Revenue" there shall 
be substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

After section 27 the heading "Number of 
Positions for Teachers in Classes." is 
repealed. 

After section 37 the heading "Employment 
Register." is repealed. 

After section 53 the heading "Temporary 
Teachers." is repealed. 

In section 42— 
(a) in paragraph (a) of sub-section 

(4) for the words "both or those" 
there shall be substituted the 
words "both of those"; and 

(b) "in paragraph (b) of sub-section 
(5) for the words "including 
any stratum estate in the said 
subdivision" there shall be 
substituted the words "including 
any stratum estate in the land". 

In section 59 AC (8) for the words "in 
relation to local" there shall be 
substituted the words "in relation to 
the local". 

In section 14 (6) (ii) for the word 
"substituted" there shall be substituted 
the word "inserted". 

In section 44 (1) for the expression "(kc) 
the making available" there shall be 
substituted the expression "(kd) the 
making available". 

In section 5 (1) for the words "the last 
preceding section" there shall be 
substituted the expression "section 4". 

In section 26 (3) for the words "State 
Savings Bank" there shall be 
substituted the words "State Bank ". 

In section 38 (2) for the expression 
"Estate Agents Act 1958" there shall 
be substituted the expression "Estate 
Agents Act 1980". 

In section 5 for the expression "hurting 
or any such person" there shall be 
substituted the expression "hurting of 
any such person". 

In section 7 (1) (e) for the expression 
"Ministry of Conservation Act 1972" 
there shall be substituted the expression 
"Ministry for Conservation Act 1972"-

In section 7 (1) (g) for the expression 
"Social Welfare Act 1970" there shall 
be substituted the expression 
"Community Welfare Services Act 
1970". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item 
No. 

Act 
No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

261 

262 

263 

264 

265 

266 

8968 Upper Yarra Valley and 
Dandenong Ranges 
Authority Act 1976— 
continued 

8052 Urban Renewal Act 1970 

9552 Urban Renewal {Amendment) 
Act 1981 

7393 Vagrancy Act 1966 

267 

268 

269 

270 

271 

272 

273 

274 

6409 Vermin and Noxious Weeds 
Act 1958 

9673 Victoria State Emergency 
Service Act 1981 

In section 24 (7), (8) and (16) for the 
words "Town Planning Appeals 
Tribunal" there shall be substituted 
the words "Planning Appeals Board". 

In section 24 (16) for the words "the 
Tribunal" there shall be substituted 
the words "the Board". 

In section 5 (2) (b) the word "specifying" 
is repealed. 

Section 10 is repealed. 

Section 3 is repealed. 
In section 4— , 

(a) in the interpretation of "Court" 
for the expression "Part IV. of the 
Justices Act 1958" there shall be 
substituted the expression "Part I. 
of the Magistrates' Courts Act 
1971"; and 

(b) in the interpretation of "Public 
place" for the expression 
"Licensing Act 1958" there shall 
be substituted the expression 
Liquor Control Act 1968". 

In section 12 (2) (b) for the expression 
"court of petty sessions" there shall be 
substituted the expression "magistrates' 
court". 

In section 20 (2) for the words 
"Consolidated Revenue" there shall be 
substituted the words "Consolidated 
Fund". 

In section 2 (1) for the word "Schedule" 
there shall be substituted the words 
"First Schedule". 

In section 3A (2) (a) the words "of 
Vermin and Noxious Weeds" shall be 
repealed. 

In sections 3c (1) and 4 (1) for the 
expression "Public Service Act 1958" 
there shall be substituted the expression 
"Public Service Act 1974". 

In section 6 (1) (c) for the words "Railway 
Construction Board" there shall be 
substituted the words "Railway 
Construction and Property Board". 

In section 6 (2) for the words "the last 
preceding sub-section" there shall be 
substituted the expression "sub-section 
(1)". 

In section 20 (d) for the expression 
"indentification" there shall be 
substituted the word "identification". 

SCHEDULE 



1983 Statute Law Revision No. 9902 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Item Act 
No. No. Title of Act Extent of Amendment or Repeal 

275 9573 Water Drainage Act 1981 

276 8699 Wildlife Act 1975 

277 9694 Wildlife (Protection of 

Whales) Act 1981 

278 6419 Workers Compensation Act 
1958 

In section 21 after the word "sections" 
there shall be inserted the words "and 
heading". 

In section 22 (5) (b) for the words "or 
sell" there shall be substituted the 
words "or to sell". 

In section 6— 
(a) for the expression "after paragraph 

(m)" there shall be substituted the 
expression "after paragraph (n)"; 
and 

(b) for the expression "(«) with any" 
there shall be substituted the 
expression "(o) with any". 

In section 85 after the words "subject 
to" there shall be inserted the word 
"the". 


